lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

At this time and prior to a post-letting review, the following projects are within a reasonable approximation of the
Estimate.

1 NO
2 NO
3 NO
4 YES
5 YES
6 YES
7 NO
8 YES
9 YES
11 No bids
12 NO
13 NO
14 YES
15 YES
16 NO
17 YES
18 YES
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lllinois Department of Transportation
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM

Letting Item: 01X Contract: 76J90 District: 8
Route: FAI 270 Section: 60B-1 County: Madison

Project: NHPP-HBFPCRP1(462)

Contract Description: Replacement of SN 060-0035 which carries 1-270 over the Mississippi River.

6344  Walsh Construction Company I, LLC

929 West Adams Street
Chicago, IL 60607

$496,247,509.09

Phone: (312) 563-5400
Fax: (312) 563-5447

3733 Massman Construction Co. and Traylor Bros., Inc. Joint Venture

4400 W 109th Street, Suite 300
Overland Park, KS 66211
Phone: (913) 291-2600

Fax: (913) 291-2601

0164  American Bridge Company

1000 American Bridge Way
Coraopolis, PA 15108

Phone: (412) 631-1000

Fax: (412) 631-2003
jmcdonald@americanbridge.net

3085 Keeley & Sons, Inc.

6303 Collinsville Road

East St. Louis, IL 62201

Phone: (618) 271-7470

Fax: (618) 271-0830
Brian.Lurk@keeleyandsons.com

$576,380,934.90

(No Bid)

(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to

determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 002 Contract: 46596 District: 6
Route: VARIOUS Section: D 6 HT PYMNT MRK RPR 23- County: Various
06
Project:

Contract Description: Pavement marking on various routes in various counties of District 6.

6024  STF, LLC d/b/a Traffic Control Company

601 8TH STREET $1.107,527.51
VALLEY PARK, MO 63088

3019 East End Avenue

South Chicago Heights, IL 60411
Phone: (636) 225-7800

Fax: (636) 225-3460
bjp@trafficcontrolcompany.com

0031  A. C. Pavement Striping Co.

695 Church Road $1 ,381 ,00386
Elgin, IL 60123

Phone: (847) 214-9500

Fax: (847) 214-9078

wbrinati@acpavement.net

5091 RoadSafe Traffic Systems, Inc.

Romeoville, IL 60446

Phone: (815) 372-2300

Fax: (815) 927-0110
bseeman@roadsafetraffic.com

6243  Varsity Striping & Construction Co.

PO Box 3055 $1,465,619.15
Champaign, IL 61826

2601 Cardinal Road

Champaign, IL 61822

Phone: (217) 352-2203

Fax: (217) 352-8339

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 003 Contract: 62P74 District: 1
Route: FAP 525 Section: 2021-157-RS County: McHenry
Project: PROTLIY0(834)

Contract Description: (2,260-Ft) Standard Overlay and ADA Improvements: HMA removal and resurfacing, Class D
patching, curb ramps (ADA) improvements, PMK of FAP 525: U.S. 20 from Page Street to Locust Street, located in
the City of Marengo in McHenry County.

0280 Peter Baker & Son Co.

1349 Rockland Road $638,757.57
Lake BIuff, IL 60044
Phone: (847) 362-3663
Fax: (847) 362-0707
john@peterbaker.com

0103  Alliance Contractors, Inc.

1166 Lake Avenue (NO Bid)
Woodstock, IL 60098

Phone: (815) 338-5900

Fax: (815) 338-9109

estimating@alliancecontractors.com

4696 Payne & Dolan, Inc.

28435 West IL Route 173 (No Bid)
Antioch, IL 60002
Phone: (847) 838-3700

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 004 Contract: 62N48 District: 1
Route: FAP 876 Section: 2021-050-CJS County: Cook; Will
Project:

Contract Description: (6.47-Mile) Crack and Joint Sealing. streiff In to scrementi lane in Will and Cook Counties.

1882  Freehill Asphalt, Inc.

PO Box 154 $318,775.52
Watseka, IL 60970

103 Yount Ave

Watseka, IL 60970

Phone: (815) 432-5438

Fax: (815) 432-5439
thomasfreehill@sbcglobal.net

5289  SKC Construction, Inc.

West Dundee, IL 60118

695 Church Road

Elgin, IL 60123

Phone: (847) 214-9800
Fax: (847) 214-9041
ttabor@skcconstruction.net

1443  Denler, Inc.

20502 S Cherry Hill Rd $478.971.75
Joliet, IL 60433

Phone: (708) 479-5005

Fax: (708) 479-5015

info@denlerinc.com

4287  Mosley Construction 1, LLC

2530 S 14000E Rd. $987,444.10
Pembroke Township, IL 60958

2530 S 14000E Rd

Pembroke Township, IL 60958

Phone: (815) 405-5033

Mosley1biz@gmail.com

0477  Antigua, Inc.

3604 N. Lavergne $1,109,331.51
Chicago, IL 60641

Phone: (773) 993-0755

Fax: (708) 669-7464

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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Letting Item: 005
Route:

lllinois Department of Transportation
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Contract: 62N57
FAP 347 Section: 2021-038-CJS
Project:

Contract Description: (9.07-Mile) Crack and Joint Sealing, Kane County.

1882

5289

1443

0477

Freehill Asphalt, Inc.

PO Box 154

Watseka, IL 60970

103 Yount Ave

Watseka, IL 60970

Phone: (815) 432-5438

Fax: (815) 432-5439
thomasfreehill@sbcglobal.net

SKC Construction, Inc.

P.O. Box 503

West Dundee, IL 60118
695 Church Road

Elgin, IL 60123

Phone: (847) 214-9800
Fax: (847) 214-9041
ttabor@skcconstruction.net

Denler, Inc.

20502 S Cherry Hill Rd
Joliet, IL 60433

Phone: (708) 479-5005
Fax: (708) 479-5015
info@denlerinc.com

Antigua, Inc.

3604 N. Lavergne
Chicago, IL 60641
Phone: (773) 993-0755
Fax: (708) 669-7464

Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM

District: 1
County: Kane

$322,192.00

$362,021.69

$497,252.30

$1,236,314.12

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 006 Contract: 62N64 District: 1
Route: FAP 343 Section: 2021-041-CJS County: Cook
Project:

Contract Description: (4.8-Mile) This improvement consists of crack and joint sealing. The project is in the Villages of
Barrington Hills, Barrington, Inverness and Palatine.

1882  Freehill Asphalt, Inc.

PO Box 154 $213,223.95
Watseka, IL 60970

103 Yount Ave

Watseka, IL 60970

Phone: (815) 432-5438

Fax: (815) 432-5439
thomasfreehill@sbcglobal.net

5289  SKC Construction, Inc.

West Dundee, IL 60118

695 Church Road

Elgin, IL 60123

Phone: (847) 214-9800
Fax: (847) 214-9041
ttabor@skcconstruction.net

1443  Denler, Inc.

20502 S Cherry Hill Rd $309,629.09
Joliet, IL 60433

Phone: (708) 479-5005

Fax: (708) 479-5015

info@denlerinc.com

0477  Antigua, Inc.

3604 N. Lavergne $597,451.69
Chicago, IL 60641

Phone: (773) 993-0755

Fax: (708) 669-7464

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 007 Contract: 62R56 District: 1
Route: FAP 372 Section: FAP-372-22-BR County: Cook
Project:

Contract Description: (1,827-Ft) The improvement consists of bridge beam repairs located on IL 171 from Joliet Rd to
the Sanitary Ship Canal in the Villages of McCook and Summit in Cook County.

5286 S & J Construction Co., Inc.

4245 166th Street $1.144,508.00
Oak Forest, IL 60452

Phone: (708) 331-1816

Fax: (708) 687-2135
ESTIMATING@SJCONST.COM

1320 D. Construction, Inc.

1488 So. Broadway $1,406,770.02
Coal City, IL 60416

Phone: (815) 634-2555

Fax: (815) 634-8748

bids@dconstruction.com

2779 ICC Group Inc.

39W866 Fabyan Parkway $1.604,000.00
Elburn, IL 60119

Phone: (630) 232-7280

Fax: (630) 232-7281

estimating@icceo.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 008 Contract: 62R64 District: 1
Route: FAI 290 Section: FAI 290 22 WW County: DuPage
Project:

Contract Description: (230-Ft) Bridge wing wall repair and the work consist of reconstructing the bridge wing wall,
structure excavation, removal and replacement of curb and gutter in the city of EImhurst, DuPage County.

2520 HERLIHY MID-CONTINENT COMPANY

1306 MARQUETTE DRIVE $362,100.00
ROMEOVILLE, IL 60446
Phone: (630) 378-1000
Fax: (630) 378-1002
becky@hmcco.net

0204  Areatha Construction Co., Inc.

410 E. North Avenue $374,432.93
Streamwood, IL 60107

Phone: (630) 830-9853

Fax: (630) 830-9856

3505 Lorig Construction Company

250 East Touhy Avenue $376,842.10
Des Plaines, IL 60018

Phone: (847) 298-0360

Fax: (847) 298-2689

estimating@lorigconstruction.com

3702 Martam Construction Incorporated

1200 Gasket Dr $394,273.20
Elgin, IL 60120

Phone: (847) 608-6800

Fax: (847) 608-6804

4677  Path Construction Company, Inc.

125 E. Algonquin Road $423.771.30
Arlington Heights, IL 60005

Phone: (847) 997-9147

Fax: (847) 398-7101

PSowa@pathcc.com

0103  Alliance Contractors, Inc.

1166 Lake Avenue $448,525.70
Woodstock, IL 60098

Phone: (815) 338-5900

Fax: (815) 338-9109

estimating@alliancecontractors.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 008 Contract: 62R64 District: 1
Route: FAI 290 Section: FAI 290 22 WW County: DuPage
Project:

Contract Description: (230-Ft) Bridge wing wall repair and the work consist of reconstructing the bridge wing wall,
structure excavation, removal and replacement of curb and gutter in the city of EImhurst, DuPage County.

3574  MYS, Incorporated

12416 S. Harlem Ave (NO Bld)
Palos Heights, IL 60463

Phone: (708) 448-0983

Fax: (708) 448-8098

tyelnick@mysincorporated.com

5832  Sumit Construction Co., Inc.

4150 W. Wrightwood Ave (No Bid)
Chicago, IL 60639

Phone: (773) 276-4600

Fax: (773) 276-4644

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 009 Contract: 64P42 District: 2
Route: FAP 301 Section: 25RS-7 County: Jo Daviess
Project: NHPPR13B(848)

Contract Description: 4.66 Miles - Cold Milling, Pavement Patching, ADA Ramps, and Hot-Mix Asphalt Galena Oaks
Drive to 0.2 Miles West of Logemann Road.

1045  Civil Constructors, Inc. d/b/a/ Helm Civil

PO Box 750 $4,639,684.65
Freeport, IL 61032

2283 Bus Hwy 20 East
Freeport, IL 61032

Phone: (815) 235-2200

Fax: (815) 235-2219
civilestimating@helmgroup.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 011 Contract: 66M52 District: 3
Route: FAI 80 Section: (32-3)HL County: Grundy
Project:

Contract Description: This work is located at the Interchange of I-80 and IL 47 in Grundy County. This work consists
of removal and replacement of highway light poles, luminaries and breakaway couplings.

No Electronic Bids

2550 H & HELECTRIC CO.

2830 Commerce Street (No Bid)
Franklin Park, IL 60131

Phone: (708) 878-2445

Fax: (708) 453-2851

louie.veneziano@hh-electric.com

3818  McGinn & McGinn d/b/a Engel Electric Co.

1514 W. 4th St. (No Bid)
Sterling, IL 61081

Phone: (815) 625-5949

Fax: (815) 625-5987

kevin@engelelectric.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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Letting Item: 012
Route: FAP 313

lllinois Department of Transportation
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Contract: 68G71

Section: (94-16HB-1)BDR,BJR,BRR

Project: NHPPNA2W(012)

Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM

District: 4
County: Warren

Contract Description: Bridge preservation to SN 094-0028 carrying Cameron Rd over US 34 (bridge deck
waterproofing and deck overlay, bridge joint replacement/repair, misc repairs) and related collateral work.

0593

1045

1908

Brandt Construction Co.

700 4th Street West

Milan, IL 61264

Phone: (309) 787-4644

Fax: (309) 787-6344
tbrandt@brandtconstructionco.com

Civil Constructors, Inc. d/b/a/ Helm Civil

PO Box 750

Freeport, IL 61032

2283 Bus Hwy 20 East
Freeport, IL 61032

Phone: (815) 235-2200

Fax: (815) 235-2219
civilestimating@helmgroup.com

Freesen, a div of UCM, Inc.

P.O. Box 13420
Springfield, IL 62791
3151 Robbins Road
Springfield, IL 62704
Phone: (217) 546-6192
Fax: (217) 546-1904
Fl@ucm.biz

$1,033,549.85

$1,131,504.10

(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 013 Contract: 68H07 District: 4
Route: FAP 64 Section: (12)PP;RS-8 County: Peoria
Project:

Contract Description: Transverse and longitudinal partial-depth patching along IL 29 from North of Gardner Ln. to
North of Lorentz Ave. in Peoria County. Total length is 2.45 miles.

1284 R. A. Cullinan and Son, a div of UCM, Inc.

P.O. Box 166 $1,141,394.19
Tremont, IL 61568

121 West Park Street
Tremont, IL 61568
Phone: (309) 925-2711
Fax: (309) 925-7131
tom.wall@ucm.biz

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 014 Contract: 68H10 District: 4
Route: FAP 671 Section: 9-PP County: Peoria
Project:

Contract Description: 1360 feet of PCC TY B Pavement Patching from Martin to Moss Avenue in Peoria.

5564 G. M. Sipes Construction, Inc.

P.0.BOX 109 $579,887.66
RUSHVILLE, IL 62681

503 E. ADAMS ST
RUSHVILLE, IL 62681
Phone: (217) 322-6543
Fax: (217) 322-4712
support@gmsipes.com

3163  Kinney Contractors, Inc.

Raymond, IL 62560
Phone: (217) 229-3322
Fax: (217) 229-3609
kinney@roadbuilder.net

0335 Otto Baum Company, Inc.

866 N. Main Street $699,660.00
Morton, IL 61550

Phone: (309) 266-7114

Fax: (309) 263-1050

johnbasham@ottobaum.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 015 Contract: 70F89 District: 5
Route: FAP 322; FRONTAGE; RD  Section: CM2023-1 County: McLean; DeWitt
Project:

Contract Description: 0.282 Mile of Standard Overlay at Median Turnaround at Mclean | Dewitt County Line South of
Heyworth and at Quest Drive Frontage Road South of Bloomington.

5183 Rowe Construction, a div of UCM, Inc.

P.0. Box 609 $242,701.21
Bloomington, IL 61702
1523 North Cottage Street
Bloomington, IL 61701
Phone: (309) 827-0091
Fax: (309) 829-0331
Rowe@ucm.biz

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 016 Contract: 70F97 District: 5
Route: VARIOUS Section: D5 GR & FENCE REPAIR County: Various
20231
Project:

Contract Description: District Wide On-call Guardrail and Fence Repairs.

1163  Collins & Hermann, Inc.

St. Louis, MO 63138

Phone: (314) 869-8000
Fax: (314) 869-8498
msedelkova@collinsandhermann.com

4424  Northern Contracting, Inc.

1851 Coltonville Rd. $1,434.014.81
Sycamore, IL 60178

Phone: (815) 895-5855

Fax: (815) 895-2117

amy@northerncontracting.net

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 017 Contract: 72401 District: 6
Route: FAP 663 Section: HANLEY PARKING 2022 County: Sangamon
Project:

Contract Description: Parking lot construction at the IDOT Central Office Headquarters and new District 6 facility in
Springfield.

3163  Kinney Contractors, Inc.

19342 E. Frontage Rd. $1,445,189.50
Raymond, IL 62560
Phone: (217) 229-3322
Fax: (217) 229-3609
kinney@roadbuilder.net

0335 Otto Baum Company, Inc.

866 N. Main Street $1,555.000.00
Morton, IL 61550

Phone: (309) 266-7114

Fax: (309) 263-1050

johnbasham@ottobaum.com

0635 P. H. Broughton & Sons, Inc.

905 N. Lincoln Ave. (No Bid)
Springfield, IL 62702

Phone: (217) 787-2393

Fax: (217) 787-2397

kent@phbroughton.com

1810 Truman L. Flatt & Sons Co., Inc.

2300 North 16th Street (No Bid)
Springfield, IL 62702

Phone: (217) 544-3471

Fax: (217) 544-0861

rem@trumanlflatt.com

2825 lllinois Valley Paving, a div of UCM, Inc.

Springdfield, IL 62791
3151 Robbins Road
Springdfield, IL 62704
Phone: (217) 546-6192
Fax: (217) 546-1904
IVP@ucm.biz

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 07/15/2022 12:12 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 07/15/2022

Letting Item: 018 Contract: 62R86 District: 1
Route: VARIOUS Section: 2022 FENCE 22 County: Various
Project:

Contract Description: This improvement consists of the repair and installation of fence along various expressway and
arterial highways in various counties throughout District One.

1746 Fence Masters, Inc.

20400 S. Cottage Grove Ave. $841.453.88
Chicago Heights, IL 60411

4424  Northern Contracting, Inc.

Sycamore, IL 60178

Phone: (815) 895-5855

Fax: (815) 895-2117
amy@northerncontracting.net

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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