Important Reminder to All Apparent Low Bidders!!!

All apparent low-bid contractors must submit the DBE Utilization Plan and DBE Participation Statement (SBE 2025 and SBE 2026) within 5 (five) calendar days post letting, including bids above the Engineer's Estimate.

Exception! In the event of a 0% DBE Goal, this process is not necessary! It is the bidder's responsibility to check the special provisions to determine the DBE Goal.

After a post letting review, bids initially identified as outside the awardable range may be awarded. In the event the bid is declared non-responsive due to failure to submit a Utilization Plan or failure to otherwise comply with the bidding procedures, the Department may elect to cause forfeiture of the penal sum of the bidder's proposal guaranty. Further, authorization to bid will not be granted on the project when advertised on a future letting.

At this time and prior to a post-letting review, the following projects are within a reasonable approximation of the Estimate.

NO NO YES NO YES YES NO

1	YES	42
2	YES	43
3	YES	44
4	YES	45
5	YES	46
6	YES	47
7	YES	48
8	YES	49
9	YES	50
10	NO	
11	YES	
12	NO	
13	YES	
14	NO	
15	YES	
16	DEL	
17	YES	
18	YES	
19	YES	
20	YES	
21	YES	
22	YES	
23	NO	
24	DEL	
25	YES	
26	NO	
27	YES	
28	YES	
	NO	
	YES	
41	YES	

Letting Item: 001 Route: VARIOUS **Contract: 46475** Section: D1 GRVD INT PVMNT MRK 18-37

District: 1 County: Various

Project:

Contract Description: Placing grooved pavement marking lines, letters, and symbols; removal of existing marking lines within the limits specified on individual work orders.

6024	STF, LLC d/b/a Traffic Control Company	
	601 8TH STREET VALLEY PARK, MO 63088 16961 STATE STREET SOUTH HOLLAND, IL 60473 Phone: (636) 225-7800 Fax: (636) 225-3460 bjp@trafficcontrolcompany.com	\$2,301,185.00
5091	RoadSafe Traffic Systems, Inc.	
	12225 Disk Drive Romeoville, IL 60446 Phone: (815) 372-2300 Fax: (815) 372-3233 bseeman@roadsafetraffic.com	\$2,386,440.00
0031	A. C. Pavement Striping Co.	
	695 Church Road Elgin, IL 60123 Phone: (847) 214-9500 Fax: (847) 214-9078 wbrinati@acpavement.net	\$3,394,985.00
3689	Marking Specialists Corporation	
	214 Crystal Street Suite C Cary, IL 60013 Phone: (847) 462-0799 Fax: (847) 462-0929 rob@markingspecialists.net	(No Bid)
5850	Superior Road Striping, Inc.	
	1980 Hawthorne Avenue Melrose Park, IL 60160 Phone: (708) 865-0718 Fax: (708) 865-0296 thermopros@sbcglobal.net	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	: 002	Contract:	46500	District: 7
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	D7 GRDRL DELIN MAINT INT 19-05	County: Various
		Project:		

Contract Description: Replacing reflectorized guardrail markers, terminal markers and placing linear delineator panels at various locations throughout District 7.

1675	Endrizzi Contracting, Inc	
	610 Old Route 146 Vienna, IL 62995 Phone: (618) 771-2888 amanda@endrizzicontracting.com	\$71,610.00
0737	CSD Environmental Services, Inc.	
	2220 Yale Blvd Springfield, IL 62703 Phone: (217) 522-4085 Fax: (217) 522-4087 frank@csdenviro.com	\$114,327.05
6024	STF, LLC d/b/a Traffic Control Company	
	601 8TH STREET VALLEY PARK, MO 63088 16961 STATE STREET SOUTH HOLLAND, IL 60473 Phone: (636) 225-7800 Fax: (636) 225-3460 bjp@trafficcontrolcompany.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	003
Route:	FAI 57

Contract: 60T43 Section: 1011.3-BR Project: NHPP3QW9(569)

District: 1 County: Cook

Contract Description: Bridge deck replacement and approach slabs of the 167th Street bridge over I-57. Other improvements include underpass lighting, guardrail installation, pavment marking and storm sewers.

1320	D. Construction, Inc.	
	1488 So. Broadway Coal City, IL 60416 Phone: (815) 634-2555 Fax: (815) 634-8748 bids@dconstruction.com	\$3,986,072.98
3505	Lorig Construction Company	
	250 East Touhy Avenue Des Plaines, IL 60018 Phone: (847) 298-0360 Fax: (847) 298-2689 dlorig@lorigconstruction.com	\$4,312,061.60
1552	Dunnet Bay Construction Company	
	115 N. Brandon Drive Glendale Heights, IL 60139 Phone: (630) 539-1200 Fax: (630) 539-4171 estimating@dunnetbay.net	\$4,358,278.88
0204	Areatha Construction Co., Inc.	
	410 E. North Avenue Streamwood, IL 60107 Phone: (630) 830-9853 Fax: (630) 830-9856	\$4,643,854.78
2520	HERLIHY MID-CONTINENT COMPANY	
	1306 MARQUETTE DRIVE ROMEOVILLE, IL 60446 Phone: (630) 378-1000 Fax: (630) 378-1002 becky@hmcco.net	\$4,693,401.08
4968	Rausch Infrastructure LLC	
	1111 East Touhy Ave Suite 120 Des Plaines, IL 60018 Phone: (708) 667-0165 Fax: (847) 813-9710 abrausch@riccllc.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	004	Contract:	60V28	District: 1
Route:	FAP 631	Section:	(111N-B) B-R	County: Will
		Project:	STP54IP(860)	

Contract Description: Replace bridge 099-0170 carrying Illinois Route 102 over Rayn's Creek with a cast in place, 3 cell culvert, in Wesley Township.

6117	Austin Tyler Construction, Inc.	
	23343 S Ridge Road Elwood, IL 60421 Phone: (815) 726-1090 Fax: (815) 726-1171	\$1,055,878.35
1320	D. Construction, Inc.	
	1488 So. Broadway Coal City, IL 60416 Phone: (815) 634-2555 Fax: (815) 634-8748 bids@dconstruction.com	\$1,088,098.24
1552	Dunnet Bay Construction Company	
	115 N. Brandon Drive Glendale Heights, IL 60139 Phone: (630) 539-1200 Fax: (630) 539-4171 estimating@dunnetbay.net	\$1,228,073.66
0204	Areatha Construction Co., Inc.	
	410 E. North Avenue Streamwood, IL 60107 Phone: (630) 830-9853 Fax: (630) 830-9856	(No Bid)
1604	Era-Valdivia Contractors, Inc.	
	11909 S. Avenue O Chicago, IL 60617 Phone: (773) 721-9350 Fax: (773) 721-8027	(No Bid)
1750	P. T. Ferro Construction Co.	
	P.O. Box 156 Joliet, IL 60434 700 South Rowell Ave. Joliet, IL 60433 Phone: (815) 726-6284 Fax: (815) 726-5614 estimating@ptferro.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	004
Route:	FAP 631

Contract: 60V28 Section: (111N-B) B-R Project: STP54IP(860) District: 1 County: Will

Contract Description: Replace bridge 099-0170 carrying Illinois Route 102 over Rayn's Creek with a cast in place, 3 cell culvert, in Wesley Township.

2520	HERLIHY MID-CONTINENT COMPANY	
	1306 MARQUETTE DRIVE ROMEOVILLE, IL 60446 Phone: (630) 378-1000 Fax: (630) 378-1002 becky@hmcco.net	(No Bid)
2880	Iroquois Paving Corporation	
	PO Box 466 Watseka, IL 60970 1889 E US Hwy 24 PO Box 466 Watseka, IL 60970 Phone: (815) 432-5211 Fax: (815) 432-5234 estimating@iroqpavcorp.com	(No Bid)
5040	Riber Construction, Inc.	
	405 S. Old Rt. 66 Dwight, IL 60420 Phone: (815) 584-3337 Fax: (815) 584-3340 riberconstruction@hotmail.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	005	Contract:	62A28
Route:	FAU 2843	Section:	2014-083B
		Project:	NHPPM1YX(015)

District: 1 County: Cook

Contract Description: Culvert replacement in the village of Calument.

1320	D. Construction, Inc.	
	1488 So. Broadway Coal City, IL 60416 Phone: (815) 634-2555 Fax: (815) 634-8748 bids@dconstruction.com	\$396,565.82
0204	Areatha Construction Co., Inc.	
	410 E. North Avenue Streamwood, IL 60107 Phone: (630) 830-9853 Fax: (630) 830-9856	\$419,588.19
3505	Lorig Construction Company	
	250 East Touhy Avenue Des Plaines, IL 60018 Phone: (847) 298-0360 Fax: (847) 298-2689 dlorig@lorigconstruction.com	\$429,731.84
1552	Dunnet Bay Construction Company	
	115 N. Brandon Drive Glendale Heights, IL 60139 Phone: (630) 539-1200 Fax: (630) 539-4171 estimating@dunnetbay.net	\$475,013.77
2520	HERLIHY MID-CONTINENT COMPANY	
	1306 MARQUETTE DRIVE ROMEOVILLE, IL 60446 Phone: (630) 378-1000 Fax: (630) 378-1002 becky@hmcco.net	\$565,673.27
4968	Rausch Infrastructure LLC	
	1111 East Touhy Ave Suite 120 Des Plaines, IL 60018 Phone: (708) 667-0165 Fax: (847) 813-9710 abrausch@riccllc.com	\$659,029.31

Letting Item: 005 Route: FAU 2843

Contract: 62A28 Section: 2014-083B Project: NHPPM1YX(015) District: 1 County: Cook

Contract Description: Culvert replacement in the village of Calument.

3069 K-Five Construction Corporation

999 Oakmont Plaza Drive Suite 200 Westmont, IL 60559 Phone: (630) 257-5600 Fax: (630) 257-6788 estimating@k-five.net

4741 Phoenix Corporation of the Quad Cities

PO Box 445 Rapids City, IL 61278 1006 Rosehill Rd Port Byron, IL 61275 Phone: (309) 523-3687 Fax: (309) 523-3752 mdecap@phoenixcorp.org (No Bid)

(No Bid)

Letting Item:	006
Route:	FAU 1551

Contract: 62B63 Section: (3363)N Project: STP6SSV(987) District: 1 County: Cook

Contract Description: Pavement widening, resurfacing, traffic signal modernization, and pedestrian ramp improvement for Plainfield Road at Willow Springs Road in Countryside.

0103	Alliance Contractors, Inc.	
	1166 Lake Avenue Woodstock, IL 60098 Phone: (815) 338-5900 Fax: (815) 338-9109 estimating@alliancecontractors.com	\$947,874.56
1560	R. W. DUNTEMAN COMPANY	
	P. O. BOX 1129 ADDISON, IL 60101 600 S. LOMBARD RD. ADDISON, IL 60101 Phone: (630) 953-1500 Fax: (630) 932-0994 estimating@rwdco.com	\$988,575.16
0392	Berger Excavating Contractors, Inc.	
	1205 Garland Rd. Wauconda, IL 60084 Phone: (847) 526-5457 Fax: (847) 526-4204 kberger@bergerexcavating.com	\$1,078,168.55
5486	Sheridan Plumbing & Sewer, Inc.	
	6754W. 74th Street Bedford Park, IL 60638 Phone: (708) 475-7100 Fax: (708) 475-7138 aaimaro@spands.com	\$1,175,688.64
1950	Gallagher Asphalt Corporation	
	18100 South Indiana Avenue Thornton, IL 60476 Phone: (708) 877-7160 Fax: (708) 877-5222 ddarden@gallagherasphalt.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 006 Route: FAU 1551 Contract: 62B63 Section: (3363)N Project: STP6SSV(987) District: 1 County: Cook

Contract Description: Pavement widening, resurfacing, traffic signal modernization, and pedestrian ramp improvement for Plainfield Road at Willow Springs Road in Countryside.

3069 K-Five Construction Corporation

999 Oakmont Plaza Drive Suite 200 Westmont, IL 60559 Phone: (630) 257-5600 Fax: (630) 257-6788 estimating@k-five.net

(No Bid)

Letting Item:	007
Route:	FAP 332

Contract: 62G45 Section: 49DM-1 Project: STP47RX(892) District: 1 County: Cook

Contract Description: Building demolition located at 1680 Sauk Trail Road in Sauk Village.

5347	Scanlon Excavating & Concrete, Inc.	
	630 S 7000 W Road Kankakee, IL 60901 Phone: 815937956 bscanlon@scanlonexcavating.net	\$85,528.50
1305	Curran Contracting Company	
	286 Memorial Court Crystal Lake, IL 60014 Phone: (815) 455-5100 Fax: (815) 455-7894 estimating@currancontracting.com	\$98,881.12
1320	D. Construction, Inc.	
	1488 So. Broadway Coal City, IL 60416 Phone: (815) 634-2555 Fax: (815) 634-8748 bids@dconstruction.com	\$105,856.28
1216	Copenhaver Construction, Inc.	
	75 Koppie Dr Gilberts, IL 60136 Phone: (847) 428-6696 Fax: (847) 428-6798	\$109,535.00
4741	Phoenix Corporation of the Quad Cities	
	PO Box 445 Rapids City, IL 61278 1006 Rosehill Rd Port Byron, IL 61275 Phone: (309) 523-3687 Fax: (309) 523-3752 mdecap@phoenixcorp.org	\$114,192.50
0392	Berger Excavating Contractors, Inc.	
	1205 Garland Rd. Wauconda, IL 60084 Phone: (847) 526-5457 Fax: (847) 526-4204 kberger@bergerexcavating.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 008 Route: VARIOUS Contract: 62G81 Section: 2018-008-GR Project: **District:** 1 **County:** Various

Contract Description: Repair and installation of guardrail along various expressways and arterial highways throughout District One.

3288	Kujo, Inc.	
	5303 Johnsburg Rd Johnsburg, IL 60051 Fax: (847) 497-9278 dan@kujoinc.com	\$1,878,925.00
2836	Industrial Fence, Inc.	
	1300 S. Kilbourn Ave. Chicago, IL 60623 Phone: (773) 521-9900	\$2,932,836.44
4055	Midwest Fence Corporation	
	900 N Kedzie Ave Chicago, IL 60651 Phone: (773) 722-6616 Fax: (773) 722-6626	(No Bid)
4424	Northern Contracting, Inc.	
	1851 Coltonville Rd. Sycamore, IL 60178 Phone: (815) 895-5855 Fax: (815) 895-2117 amy@northerncontracting.net	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 009 Route: VARIOUS Contract: 62G82 Section: 2018-009-GR Project: **District:** 1 **County:** Various

Contract Description: High tensin cable barrier repairs on various expressway medians district wide.

1746	Fence Masters, Inc.	
	20400 S. Cottage Grove Ave. Chicago Heights, IL 60411	\$344,475.00
4424	Northern Contracting, Inc.	
	1851 Coltonville Rd. Sycamore, IL 60178 Phone: (815) 895-5855 Fax: (815) 895-2117 amy@northerncontracting.net	\$371,550.00
2836	Industrial Fence, Inc.	
	1300 S. Kilbourn Ave. Chicago, IL 60623 Phone: (773) 521-9900	\$719,219.00
4055	Midwest Fence Corporation	
	900 N Kedzie Ave Chicago, IL 60651 Phone: (773) 722-6616 Fax: (773) 722-6626	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 010 Route: FAP 308 Contract: 64J48 Section: (3BR)M-1 Project: STPX8AR(278) District: 2 County: Rock Island

Contract Description: Installation of scour countermeasures at SN 081-9905 carrying US 67 over the Mississippi River.

0672	Byrne & Jones Marine LLC		
	PO Box 1207 Tremont, IL 61568 22260 IL RTE 9 Tremont, IL 61568		\$2,498,590.00
4741	Phoenix Corporation of the Quad	Cities	
	PO Box 445 Rapids City, IL 61278 1006 Rosehill Rd Port Byron, IL 61275 Phone: (309) 523-3687 Fax: (309) 523-3752 mdecap@phoenixcorp.org		\$2,686,933.00
0593	Brandt Construction Co.		
	700 4th Street West Milan, IL 61264 Phone: (309) 787-4644 Fax: (309) 787-6344 tbrandt@brandtconstructionco.cc	m	(No Bid)
1045	Civil Constructors, Inc.		
	PO Box 750 Freeport, IL 61032 2283 Bus Hwy 20 East Freeport, IL 61032 Phone: (815) 235-2200 Fax: (815) 235-2219 civilestimating@civilinc.com		(No Bid)
2323	Halverson Construction Co., Inc.		
	620 N. 19th St. Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 753-0027 Fax: (217) 753-1904 hbid@halversonconstruction.com		(No Bid)

Letting Item: 010 Route: FAP 308 Contract: 64J48 Section: (3BR)M-1 Project: STPX8AR(278) **District:** 2 **County:** Rock Island

Contract Description: Installation of scour countermeasures at SN 081-9905 carrying US 67 over the Mississippi River.

3243	Kovilic Construction Company, Inc.	
	PO Box 939 Franklin Park, IL 60131-0939 3721 N. Carnation St. Franklin Park, IL 60131-0939 Phone: (847) 671-4978	(No Bid)
3810	McCarthy Improvement Company	
	5401 Victoria Avenue Davenport, IA 52807 Phone: (563) 359-0321 Fax: (563) 344-3717 estimating@mccarthyimprovement.com	(No Bid)
5737	St. Louis Bridge Construction Company	
	655 Landmark Drive Arnold, MO 63010 Phone: (636) 296-3300 Fax: (636) 296-7416	(No Bid)
6210	Valley Construction Co.	
	3610 78 Avenue West P.O. Box 2020 Rock Island, IL 61201 3610 78 Avenue West Rock Island, IL 61201 Phone: (309) 787-0292 Fax: (309) 787-7048 estimating@valleyconstruction.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 011 Route: FAI 39 Contract: 64M77 Section: (141-1HB-2)BRR Project: District: 2 County: Ogle

Contract Description: Repair Bridge SN 071-0061 carrying Creston Road over FAI 39.

5570	Sjostrom & Sons, Inc.	
	PO Box 5766 Rockford, IL 61125 1129 Harrison Ave. Rockford, IL 61104 Phone: (815) 226-0330 Fax: (815) 226-8868 heavyhighway@sjostromconstruction.com	\$1,721,199.96
3706	Martin & Company Excavating	
	P.O. Box 443 Oregon, IL 61061 2456 E. Pleasant Grove Road Oregon, IL 61061 Phone: (815) 732-2422 Fax: (815) 732-2092	\$1,973,480.10
1045	Civil Constructors, Inc.	
	PO Box 750 Freeport, IL 61032 2283 Bus Hwy 20 East Freeport, IL 61032 Phone: (815) 235-2200 Fax: (815) 235-2219 civilestimating@civilinc.com	\$1,981,106.80
0103	Alliance Contractors, Inc.	
	1166 Lake Avenue Woodstock, IL 60098 Phone: (815) 338-5900 Fax: (815) 338-9109 estimating@alliancecontractors.com	\$2,078,437.61
1604	Era-Valdivia Contractors, Inc.	
	11909 S. Avenue O Chicago, IL 60617 Phone: (773) 721-9350 Fax: (773) 721-8027	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 011 Route: FAI 39 Contract: 64M77 Section: (141-1HB-2)BRR Project: District: 2 County: Ogle

Contract Description: Repair Bridge SN 071-0061 carrying Creston Road over FAI 39.

5737 St. Louis Bridge Construction Company

655 Landmark Drive Arnold, MO 63010 Phone: (636) 296-3300 Fax: (636) 296-7416

(No Bid)

Letting Item: 012 Route: VARIOUS Contract: 66H68 Section: D3-J REPLACEMENT FY 2018 Project: HSIPJ711(634) **District:** 3 **County:** DeKalb; Kendall

Contract Description: Guardrail end section replacement on various routes in DeKalb and Kendall Counties.

1305	Curran Contracting Company	
	286 Memorial Court Crystal Lake, IL 60014 Phone: (815) 455-5100 Fax: (815) 455-7894 estimating@currancontracting.com	\$1,677,677.00
4424	Northern Contracting, Inc.	
	1851 Coltonville Rd. Sycamore, IL 60178 Phone: (815) 895-5855 Fax: (815) 895-2117 amy@northerncontracting.net	\$1,895,918.61
1163	Collins & Hermann, Inc.	
	1215 Dunn Road St. Louis, MO 63138 Phone: (314) 869-8000 Fax: (314) 869-8498 msedelkova@collinsandhermann.com	\$2,364,298.00
3524	Lovewell Fencing, Inc.	
	21060 Holden Drive Davenport, IA 52806 Phone: (563) 391-7025 Fax: (563) 391-4005 jschulz@lovewellfence.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 013 Route: VARIOUS Contract: 66J47 Section: TREE REMOVAL ON-CALL FY19 Project: **District:** 3 **County:** Various

Contract Description: On-Call tree removal along state maintained routes, district wide.

2661	Homer Tree Service, Inc.	
	14000 S. Archer Ave. Lockport, IL 60441 Phone: (815) 838-0320 Fax: (815) 838-6027	\$40,500.00
3353	Lion Construction 1, LLC	
	2598 S. 14000 E. Road Pembroke Twp, IL 60958 Phone: (815) 944-5788 Fax: (815) 944-5787 lajobiemosley@att.net	(No Bid)
4373	Nettle Creek Nursery, Inc.	
	1201 Fremont Ave Morris, IL 60450 320 Ottawa Street Morris, IL 60450 Phone: (815) 693-9763 nettlecreeknursery@gmail.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 014 Route: FAP 661 Contract: 68E47 Section: (102B-1)SCR Project: District: 4 County: Peoria

Contract Description: Scour mitigation at SN 072-0034 carrying IL 90 over Prince Run.

2824	Illinois Civil Contractors, Inc.	
	420 Pinecrest Drive East Peoria, IL 61611 Phone: (309) 694-4224 Fax: (309) 694-5676 mfehr@ilcivil.com	\$155,436.00
2663	Lee Hood d/b/a Hood Demolition & Excavation	
	17382 Old Airport Road Rushville, IL 62681 Phone: (217) 322-3712 Fax: (217) 322-2590 hood13@frontiernet.net	\$169,808.57
0737	CSD Environmental Services, Inc.	
	2220 Yale Blvd Springfield, IL 62703 Phone: (217) 522-4085 Fax: (217) 522-4087 frank@csdenviro.com	\$191,139.50
1232	County Contractors, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 3522 Quincy, IL 62305 1228 East 1350th Street Quincy, IL 62305 Phone: (217) 885-3550 Fax: (217) 885-3575 chris@countycontractorsinc.com	(No Bid)
5737	St. Louis Bridge Construction Company	
	655 Landmark Drive Arnold, MO 63010 Phone: (636) 296-3300 Fax: (636) 296-7416	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	015
Route:	FAI 74

Contract: 68E65 Section: (90-15-1)PP Project: District: 4 County: Tazewell

Contract Description: Patching and joint repair on the on-ramps and off-ramps at the westbound I-74 Morton interchange.

5564	G. M. Sipes Construction, Inc.	
	P.O. BOX 109 RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 503 E. ADAMS ST RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 Phone: (217) 322-6543 Fax: (217) 322-4712 support@gmsipes.com	\$261,656.33
0335	Otto Baum Company, Inc.	
	866 N. Main Street Morton, IL 61550 Phone: (309) 266-7114 Fax: (309) 263-1050 estimating@ottobaum.com	\$308,114.08
3163	Kinney Contractors, Inc.	
	19342 E. Frontage Rd. Raymond, IL 62560 Phone: (217) 229-3322 Fax: (217) 229-3609 kinney@roadbuilder.net	\$335,287.40
5672	Stark Excavating, Inc.	
	1805 W Washington St. Bloomington, IL 61701 Phone: (309) 828-5034 Fax: (309) 829-3897 estimating@starkcompanies.com	\$369,900.00
0385	Beniach Construction Co., Inc.	
	P.O. Box 20 Tuscola, IL 61953 307 S. Main Street Tuscola, IL 61953 Phone: (217) 253-6100 Fax: (217) 253-6144 jerry@beniachconstruction.com	\$396,320.01

Letting Item:	015
Route:	FAI 74

Contract: 68E65 Section: (90-15-1)PP Project: District: 4 County: Tazewell

Contract Description: Patching and joint repair on the on-ramps and off-ramps at the westbound I-74 Morton interchange.

2824	Illinois Civil Contractors, Inc.	
	420 Pinecrest Drive East Peoria, IL 61611 Phone: (309) 694-4224 Fax: (309) 694-5676 mfehr@ilcivil.com	\$396,459.56
1284	R. A. Cullinan and Son, a div of UCM, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 166 Tremont, IL 61568 121 West Park Street Tremont, IL 61568 Phone: (309) 925-2711 Fax: (309) 925-7131 RACullinan@UCM.biz	\$467,782.39
1232	County Contractors, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 3522 Quincy, IL 62305 1228 East 1350th Street Quincy, IL 62305 Phone: (217) 885-3550 Fax: (217) 885-3575 chris@countycontractorsinc.com	(No Bid)
1604	Era-Valdivia Contractors, Inc.	
	11909 S. Avenue O Chicago, IL 60617 Phone: (773) 721-9350 Fax: (773) 721-8027	(No Bid)
3391	Laverdiere Construction, Inc.	
	4055 W Jackson St Macomb, IL 61455 Phone: (309) 837-1258 Fax: (309) 833-4993 mlynn@lavconinc.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 016	Deleted	Contract: 70D07	District: 5
Route:		Section:	County: Vermilion
		Project:	

Contract Description: New shoulders and milled rumble strip from US 136 to Kennekuk Park northwest of Danville.

No Electronic Bids

No Authorized Bidders

Letting Item:	: 017	Contract:	70D23	District: 5
Route:	FAI 74	Section:	D5 BRIDGE PAINTING 2019-1	County: DeWitt
		Project:	NHPPXUJN(924)	

Contract Description: Four spot locations of bridge painting on FAI 74 over US 150 and FAS 2495.

6254	Venus Painting Co.	
	443 Forestwood Drive Valparaiso, IN 46385 Phone: (219) 531-9384 Fax: (219) 531-9384	\$696,800.00
5942	Thomas Industrial Coatings, Inc.	
	2070 Hwy. Z Pevely, MO 63070 Phone: (636) 475-3500 Fax: (636) 475-3512	\$1,042,262.00
5963	Three Star Painting, Inc.	
	2880 East 84th Place Merrillville, IN 46410 Phone: (219) 947-3021 Fax: (219) 947-3031	\$1,070,307.00
2766	Civil Coatings and Construction Inc.	
	1651 West Lincolnway Valparaiso, IN 46385 Phone: (219) 531-5300 Fax: (219) 531-5301 jtsahas@civilcoatings.com	\$1,951,400.00
0115	All States Painting, Inc.	
	PO Box 110 Alexander, IL 62601 1458 State Highway 123 Alexander, IL 62601 Phone: (217) 478-2111 Fax: (217) 478-4881	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	: 018	Contract:	70D35	District:	5
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	D5 HSIP GR 2019-1	County:	DeWitt; McLean; Vermilion
		Project:	HSIP-HRRRFPJV(789)		

Contract Description: Guardrail improvements at 111 locations on various routes in Vermilion, McLean, and Dewitt Counties.

3524	Lovewell Fencing, Inc.	
	21060 Holden Drive Davenport, IA 52806 Phone: (563) 391-7025 Fax: (563) 391-4005 jschulz@lovewellfence.com	\$1,446,914.50
2836	Industrial Fence, Inc.	
	1300 S. Kilbourn Ave. Chicago, IL 60623 Phone: (773) 521-9900	\$1,493,575.76
4055	Midwest Fence Corporation	
	900 N Kedzie Ave Chicago, IL 60651 Phone: (773) 722-6616 Fax: (773) 722-6626	\$1,619,622.03
1163	Collins & Hermann, Inc.	
	1215 Dunn Road St. Louis, MO 63138 Phone: (314) 869-8000 Fax: (314) 869-8498 msedelkova@collinsandhermann.com	\$1,853,484.96
1112	Clevenger Contractors, Inc.	
	PO Box 19 Bluffs, IL 62621 355 Naples Road Bluffs, IL 62621 Phone: (217) 754-3411 Fax: (217) 754-3537 clever@irtc.net	(No Bid)
4424	Northern Contracting, Inc.	
	1851 Coltonville Rd. Sycamore, IL 60178 Phone: (815) 895-5855 Fax: (815) 895-2117 amy@northerncontracting.net	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 019 Route: FAU 7998 Contract: 72K68 Section: (110X-2) RS-4 Project: **District:** 6 **County:** Sangamon

Contract Description: HMA surface removal and replacement on East Lke Shore Drive starting at just east of I-55 and proceeding east for 0.67 miles.

1810	Truman L. Flatt & Sons Co., Inc.	
	2300 North 16th Street Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 544-3471 Fax: (217) 544-0861 rem@trumanlflatt.com	\$161,777.42
2825	Illinois Valley Paving, a div of UCM, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 13420 Springfield, IL 62791 3151 Robbins Road Springfield, IL 62704 Phone: (217) 546-6192 Fax: (217) 546-1904 IVP@ucm.biz	\$169,050.02
0635	P. H. Broughton & Sons, Inc.	
	905 N. Lincoln Ave. Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 787-2393 Fax: (217) 787-2397 kent@phbroughton.com	\$181,698.95

Letting Item: 020 Route: FAP 315

hood13@frontiernet.net

Contract: 72K70 Section: (123)CR Project: District: 6 County: Mason

Contract Description: Installing a cross road pipe culvert, pavement patching and ditch improvements on US 136 between CR 3200E and Cr 3300E.

5564	G. M. Sipes Construction, Inc.	
	P.O. BOX 109 RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 503 E. ADAMS ST RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 Phone: (217) 322-6543 Fax: (217) 322-4712 support@gmsipes.com	\$36,717.00
1232	County Contractors, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 3522 Quincy, IL 62305 1228 East 1350th Street Quincy, IL 62305 Phone: (217) 885-3550 Fax: (217) 885-3575 chris@countycontractorsinc.com	\$38,898.50
0737	CSD Environmental Services, Inc.	
	2220 Yale Blvd Springfield, IL 62703 Phone: (217) 522-4085 Fax: (217) 522-4087 frank@csdenviro.com	\$47,978.62
4832	Prado Construction	
	1875 Weil Road Troy, IL 62294 Phone: (618) 667-9375 Fax: (618) 667-9375	\$48,288.58
2663	Lee Hood d/b/a Hood Demolition & Excavation	
	17382 Old Airport Road Rushville, IL 62681 Phone: (217) 322-3712 Fax: (217) 322-2590	\$67,036.75

Letting Item: 020 Route: FAP 315 Contract: 72K70 Section: (123)CR Project: District: 6 County: Mason

Contract Description: Installing a cross road pipe culvert, pavement patching and ditch improvements on US 136 between CR 3200E and Cr 3300E.

2824 Illinois Civil Contractors, Inc.

420 Pinecrest Drive East Peoria, IL 61611 Phone: (309) 694-4224 Fax: (309) 694-5676 mfehr@ilcivil.com

(No Bid)

Letting Item:	: 021	Contract:	74870	District: 7
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	D7 WEED CONT SPRAYING 2019-1	County: Macon
		Project:		

Contract Description: Weed spraying along US 51 and I-72.

1675	Endrizzi Contracting, Inc	
	610 Old Route 146 Vienna, IL 62995 Phone: (618) 771-2888 amanda@endrizzicontracting.com	\$90,537.50
1336	The Daltons Inc.	
	PO Box 724 North Webster, IN 46555 8857 N Syracuse Webster Road Syracuse, IN 46567 Phone: (574) 267-7511 Fax: (574) 267-7043 angie@thedaltonsinc.com	\$95,118.00
0737	CSD Environmental Services, Inc.	
	2220 Yale Blvd Springfield, IL 62703 Phone: (217) 522-4085 Fax: (217) 522-4087 frank@csdenviro.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 022 Route: FAI 57

District: 7 **Contract:** 74871 Section: D7 ASH BORER CONTROL 2019-1 **Project:**

County: Effingham

Contract Description: Tree removal in the ROW and median of I-57 from mile marker 164 to the Shelby County line.

4229	J.H. Moore, Inc.	
	PO Box 311 Altamont, IL 62411 5914 N 200th St Mason, IL 62443 Phone: (217) 536-5152 Fax: (866) 579-5245 jason@jhmoore.net	\$89,200.00
2946	J & M Highway Safety, LLC	
	8827 E. 750th. Ave. Altamont, IL 62411 Phone: (217) 536-5491 Fax: (217) 536-6108 joemary7@hotmail.com	\$120,500.00
1675	Endrizzi Contracting, Inc	
	610 Old Route 146 Vienna, IL 62995 Phone: (618) 771-2888 amanda@endrizzicontracting.com	\$134,500.16
0737	CSD Environmental Services, Inc.	
	2220 Yale Blvd Springfield, IL 62703 Phone: (217) 522-4085 Fax: (217) 522-4087 frank@csdenviro.com	\$146,360.00
4832	Prado Construction	
	1875 Weil Road Troy, IL 62294 Phone: (618) 667-9375 Fax: (618) 667-9375	\$147,436.94
0437	Arborworks LLC	
	1202N 75th St #222 Downers Grove, IL 60516 1202 N 75th Street Downers Grove, IL 60516	\$157,950.00

 Letting Item:
 022
 Contract:
 74871
 District:
 7

 Route:
 FAI 57
 Section:
 D7 ASH BORER CONTROL
 County:
 Effingham

 Project:
 Project:
 Fright and the section of the sectio

Contract Description: Tree removal in the ROW and median of I-57 from mile marker 164 to the Shelby County line.

3353	Lion Construction 1, LLC	
	2598 S. 14000 E. Road Pembroke Twp, IL 60958 Phone: (815) 944-5788 Fax: (815) 944-5787 Iajobiemosley@att.net	\$175,536.00
4373	Nettle Creek Nursery, Inc.	
	1201 Fremont Ave Morris, IL 60450 320 Ottawa Street Morris, IL 60450 Phone: (815) 693-9763 nettlecreeknursery@gmail.com	(No Bid)
6604	Yeagle's Forestry Mulching & Land Management	
	14105 Woodridge Road Farmer City, IL 61842	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 023 Route: FAS 1720

Contract:	74872	District: 7
Section:	D7 HMA SAFETY SHLD 2019-	County: Richland
Project:	I HSIP-HRRRDBR2(180)	

Contract Description: Construction of HMA safety shoulders, aggregate shoulder wedge and milled rumble strips on IL 250 beginning at Linn Street in Olney and extending southwest for 8.8 miles.

2692	Howell Paving, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 1009	\$1,825,938.43
	Mattoon, IL 61938	+ ,,==0,0000000
	1020 N. 13th Street	
	Mattoon, IL 61938	
	Phone: (217) 234-8877	
	Fax: (217) 234-4226	
	estimates@howellco.com	

Letting Item: 024	Deleted	Contract: 76J81	District: 8
Route:		Section:	County: St. Clair
		Project:	

Contract Description: ADA improvement on N Belt West from Frank Scott Parkway to 17th Street in Belleville

No Electronic Bids

No Authorized Bidders

Letting Item: 025 Route: FAP 103 Contract: 76K66 Section: 25VB-B-R-1 Project: District: 8 County: St. Clair

Contract Description: Repair bridge SN 082-0299 carrying IL 13 over the ICG Railroad, 2.5 miles south of Freeburg.

3157	The Kilian Corporation	
	P.O. Box A Mascoutah, IL 62258 608 South Independence Street Mascoutah, IL 62258 Phone: (618) 566-2000 Fax: (618) 566-2314 sharon.weier@kiliancorp.com	\$387,791.86
3085	Keeley & Sons, Inc.	
	6303 Collinsville Road East St. Louis, IL 62201 Phone: (618) 271-7470 Fax: (618) 271-0830 Brian.Lurk@keeleyandsons.com	\$389,826.46
4757	Plocher Construction Company, Inc.	
	2808 Thole-Plocher Road Highland, IL 62249 Phone: (618) 654-9408 Fax: (618) 654-6454 bids@plocherco.com	\$478,439.50
3108	Keller Construction, Inc.	
	22 Illini Drive Glen Carbon, IL 62034 Phone: (618) 656-0033 Fax: (618) 656-7134	\$499,190.50
3243	Kovilic Construction Company, Inc.	
	PO Box 939 Franklin Park, IL 60131-0939 3721 N. Carnation St. Franklin Park, IL 60131-0939 Phone: (847) 671-4978	\$771,116.00
0338	Baxmeyer Construction, Inc.	
	1034 Floraville Road Waterloo, IL 62298 Phone: (618) 939-3000 Fax: (618) 939-4299	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	025
Route:	FAP 103

Contract: 76K66 Section: 25VB-B-R-1 Project: District: 8 County: St. Clair

Contract Description: Repair bridge SN 082-0299 carrying IL 13 over the ICG Railroad, 2.5 miles south of Freeburg.

1604	Era-Valdivia Contractors, Inc.	
	11909 S. Avenue O Chicago, IL 60617 Phone: (773) 721-9350 Fax: (773) 721-8027	(No Bid)
5526	Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC	
	PO Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 7038 Highway 154 P.O. Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 Phone: (618) 924-1077 Fax: (618) 625-6516 bdorrissbcllc@hotmail.com	(No Bid)
5737	St. Louis Bridge Construction Company	
	655 Landmark Drive Arnold, MO 63010 Phone: (636) 296-3300 Fax: (636) 296-7416	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 026 Route: FAI 70 Contract: 76L45 Section: 82-2-1PS-1 Project: District: 8 County: St. Clair

Contract Description: Structural repairs at the Bowman Pump Station on Exchange Avenue in East St. Louis.

1356	Davinroy Mechanical Contractor, Inc.	
	44 Empire Drive Belleville, IL 62220 Phone: (618) 233-1112 Fax: (618) 233-1115 davinroymech@peaknet.net	\$124,141.81
4757	Plocher Construction Company, Inc.	
	2808 Thole-Plocher Road Highland, IL 62249 Phone: (618) 654-9408 Fax: (618) 654-6454 bids@plocherco.com	\$134,750.00
3085	Keeley & Sons, Inc.	
	6303 Collinsville Road East St. Louis, IL 62201 Phone: (618) 271-7470 Fax: (618) 271-0830 Brian.Lurk@keeleyandsons.com	\$138,354.88
3108	Keller Construction, Inc.	
	22 Illini Drive Glen Carbon, IL 62034 Phone: (618) 656-0033 Fax: (618) 656-7134	(No Bid)
5310	Sangamo Construction Company	
	2100 East Moffat St Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 544-9871 Fax: (217) 544-9873 office@sangamo.net	(No Bid)
5737	St. Louis Bridge Construction Company	
	655 Landmark Drive Arnold, MO 63010 Phone: (636) 296-3300 Fax: (636) 296-7416	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 027 Route: FAP 304 Contract: 76L77 Section: 266BR-1-I-3 Project: District: 8 County: Calhoun

Contract Description: Repair and maintenance of the electrical equipment on the Joe Page Bridge (SN 031-0001) in Hardin.

6537	Wissehr Electric, Inc.	
	5801 W State Route 161 Belleville, IL 62223 Phone: (618) 398-7575 Fax: (618) 398-7180 jk@wissehr.com	\$58,365.75
1671	Electrico, Inc.	
	7706 Wagner Road Millstadt, IL 62260 Phone: (618) 538-9500 Fax: (618) 538-7878 matt@electricoinc.us	(No Bid)

 Letting Item:
 028
 Contract:
 76L78
 District:
 8

 Route:
 VARIOUS
 Section:
 DIST 8 ELECTRICAL 2019-1
 County:
 Various

 Project:
 Project:
 Various
 Project:
 Various

Contract Description: Repair and maintenance of electrical equipment at various pump stations throughout District 8.

1671	Electrico, Inc.	
	7706 Wagner Road Millstadt, IL 62260 Phone: (618) 538-9500 Fax: (618) 538-7878 matt@electricoinc.us	\$65,547.93
6537	Wissehr Electric, Inc.	
	5801 W State Route 161 Belleville, IL 62223 Phone: (618) 398-7575 Fax: (618) 398-7180 jk@wissehr.com	\$80,006.18

Letting Item:	029	Contract:	76L79	District: 8
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	DIST 8 DEEP WELLS 2019-1	County: St. Clair
		Project:		

Contract Description: Well treatment at various locations within District 8.

3413	Layne Christensen Company	
	2399 Cassens Drive Fenton, MO 63026 Phone: (636) 343-3700 Fax: (636) 343-4614 Tom.Turnock@layne.com	\$677,410.00
1356	Davinroy Mechanical Contractor, Inc.	
	44 Empire Drive Belleville, IL 62220 Phone: (618) 233-1112 Fax: (618) 233-1115 davinroymech@peaknet.net	(No Bid)
5737	St. Louis Bridge Construction Company	
	655 Landmark Drive Arnold, MO 63010 Phone: (636) 296-3300 Fax: (636) 296-7416	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 030 Route: VARIOUS Contract: 76L92 Section: DIST 8 WEED SPRAYING 2019-1 Project: District: 8 County: Various

Contract Description: Weed spraying along I-64, I-55, I-55/70, I-255, I-270, and IL 255.

1675	Endrizzi Contracting, Inc	
	610 Old Route 146 Vienna, IL 62995	\$99,284.00
	Phone: (618) 771-2888 amanda@endrizzicontracting.com	
4000		
1336	The Daltons Inc.	
	PO Box 724	\$99,872.00
	North Webster, IN 46555	\$00,072.00
	8857 N Syracuse Webster Road	
	Syracuse, IN 46567	
	Phone: (574) 267-7511	
	Fax: (574) 267-7043	
	angie@thedaltonsinc.com	

Letting Item: 031 Route: VARIOUS Contract: 76L93 Section: DIST 8 WEED SPRAYING 2019-2 Project: District: 8 County: Various

Contract Description: Weed spraying for Johnson Grass along I-64, I-55, I-55/70, I-255, I-270 and IL 255.

1336	The Daltons Inc.		
	PO Box 724 North Webster, IN 46555 8857 N Syracuse Webster Road Syracuse, IN 46567 Phone: (574) 267-7511 Fax: (574) 267-7043 angie@thedaltonsinc.com	5	559,336.00
1675	Endrizzi Contracting, Inc		
	610 Old Route 146 Vienna, IL 62995 Phone: (618) 771-2888 amanda@endrizzicontracting.com	Ş	60,297.50

Letting Item:	032	Contract:	76L94	District: 8
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	DIST 8 TREE MIT 2019-1	County: Various
		Project:		

Contract Description: Tree removal and mitigation at various locations throughout District 8.

5802	Stutz Excavating, Inc.	
	3837 Fosterburg Road Alton, IL 62002 Phone: (618) 259-2485	\$151,861.00
4832	Prado Construction	
	1875 Weil Road Troy, IL 62294 Phone: (618) 667-9375 Fax: (618) 667-9375	\$192,350.40
1675	Endrizzi Contracting, Inc	
	610 Old Route 146 Vienna, IL 62995 Phone: (618) 771-2888 amanda@endrizzicontracting.com	\$197,116.00
4373	Nettle Creek Nursery, Inc.	
	1201 Fremont Ave Morris, IL 60450 320 Ottawa Street Morris, IL 60450 Phone: (815) 693-9763 nettlecreeknursery@gmail.com	\$308,800.00
0737	CSD Environmental Services, Inc.	
	2220 Yale Blvd Springfield, IL 62703 Phone: (217) 522-4085 Fax: (217) 522-4087 frank@csdenviro.com	(No Bid)
3353	Lion Construction 1, LLC	
	2598 S. 14000 E. Road Pembroke Twp, IL 60958 Phone: (815) 944-5788 Fax: (815) 944-5787 Iajobiemosley@att.net	(No Bid)
3752	Mayer Landscaping, Inc.	
	3620 High Prairie School Road Belleville, IL 62220	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 032 Route: VARIOUS Contract: 76L94 Section: DIST 8 TREE MIT 2019-1 Project:

District: 8 County: Various

Contract Description: Tree removal and mitigation at various locations throughout District 8.

6604 Yeagle's Forestry Mulching & Land Management

14105 Woodridge Road Farmer City, IL 61842

(No Bid)

Letting Item: 033 Route: FAS 927 Contract: 78615 Section: D9 BRIDGE REPAIR 2018-4 Project: NHPP4A87(854) District: 9 County: Johnson

Contract Description: Bridge repairs including joint reconstruction, overlay removal and replacement bearing removal and replacement, structural steel repairs and substructure repairs on SN 044-0035 carrying Tunnel Hill Road over I-24.

5526	Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC	
	PO Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 7038 Highway 154 P.O. Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 Phone: (618) 924-1077 Fax: (618) 625-6516 bdorrissbcllc@hotmail.com	\$297,796.29
5550	E. T. Simonds Construction Company	
	PO Box 2107 Carbondale, IL 62902 1500 N Oakland Ave PO Box 2107 Carbondale, IL 62902 Phone: (618) 457-8191 Fax: (618) 549-0131 mrodewald@etsimonds.com	\$303,250.93
3243	Kovilic Construction Company, Inc.	
	PO Box 939 Franklin Park, IL 60131-0939 3721 N. Carnation St. Franklin Park, IL 60131-0939 Phone: (847) 671-4978	\$539,882.00
5737	St. Louis Bridge Construction Company	
	655 Landmark Drive Arnold, MO 63010 Phone: (636) 296-3300 Fax: (636) 296-7416	(No Bid)

 Letting Item:
 034
 Contract:
 78679
 District:
 9

 Route:
 FAI 57
 Section:
 D9 WEED SPRAY 2019-2
 County:
 Various

 Project:
 Project:</t

Contract Description: Weed spraying on I-57 in Alexander, Pulaski and Union Counties.

1675	Endrizzi Contracting, Inc	
	610 Old Route 146 Vienna, IL 62995 Phone: (618) 771-2888 amanda@endrizzicontracting.com	\$86,883.50
1336	The Daltons Inc.	
	PO Box 724 North Webster, IN 46555 8857 N Syracuse Webster Road Syracuse, IN 46567 Phone: (574) 267-7511 Fax: (574) 267-7043 angie@thedaltonsinc.com	\$107,322.00

Letting Item: 035 Route: VARIOUS Contract: 62F52 Section: 2017-033-I Project: **District:** 1 **County:** Various

Contract Description: Annual maintenance and operation of traffic signals, highway lighting, pump stations, surveillance, and other electrical systems in District 1.

3948	Meade Inc.	
	9550 W. 55th Street	\$26,979,205.00
	Suite A	+,,,
	McCook, IL 60525	
	Phone: (708) 588-2500	
	Fax: (708) 588-2501	
	dal@meade100.com	
0800	Aldridge Electric, Inc.	
	844 E. Rockland Rd.	(No Bid)
	Libertyville, IL 60048	()
	Phone: (847) 680-5200	
	Fax: (847) 680-5233	
	ggiovannetti@aldridgegroup.com	

Letting Item:	036	Contract:	76L55	District:	8
Route:	FAP 761; FAP 304	Section:	1011-7, 119-1-3	-	Calhoun; Greene; Jersey
		Project:	FBDXF00(566)		, ,

Contract Description: Removal and replacement of the Kampsville and Brussels Ferry loading docks.

5737	St. Louis Bridge Construction Company	
	655 Landmark Drive Arnold, MO 63010 Phone: (636) 296-3300 Fax: (636) 296-7416	\$614,598.75
2323	Halverson Construction Co., Inc.	
	620 N. 19th St. Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 753-0027 Fax: (217) 753-1904 hbid@halversonconstruction.com	\$626,940.00
5310	Sangamo Construction Company	
	2100 East Moffat St Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 544-9871 Fax: (217) 544-9873 office@sangamo.net	\$627,177.56
3085	Keeley & Sons, Inc.	
	6303 Collinsville Road East St. Louis, IL 62201 Phone: (618) 271-7470 Fax: (618) 271-0830 Brian.Lurk@keeleyandsons.com	\$639,281.70
5802	Stutz Excavating, Inc.	
	3837 Fosterburg Road Alton, IL 62002 Phone: (618) 259-2485	\$644,927.50
3243	Kovilic Construction Company, Inc.	
	PO Box 939 Franklin Park, IL 60131-0939 3721 N. Carnation St. Franklin Park, IL 60131-0939 Phone: (847) 671-4978	\$1,114,650.00

Letting Item	: 036	Contract:	76L55	District:	8
Route:	FAP 761; FAP 304	Section:	1011-7, 119-1-3	County:	Calhoun; Greene; Jersey
		Project:	FBDXF00(566)		, ,

Contract Description: Removal and replacement of the Kampsville and Brussels Ferry loading docks.

3108	Keller Construction, Inc.	
	22 Illini Drive Glen Carbon, IL 62034 Phone: (618) 656-0033 Fax: (618) 656-7134	(No Bid)
3736	Massman Construction Co.	
	4400 W. 109th Street Suite 300 Overland Park, KS 66211 Phone: (913) 291-2601 Fax: (913) 291-2600	(No Bid)
4757	Plocher Construction Company, Inc.	
	2808 Thole-Plocher Road Highland, IL 62249 Phone: (618) 654-9408 Fax: (618) 654-6454 bids@plocherco.com	(No Bid)

		Accepted Ta	abulation of Bids : 09/21/2018	
Letting Route:	g Item: 037 :	Contract: Section:	78645 (91-3,91-4,41)CLV-1	District: 9 County: Williamson;
		Project:	NHPP-STPA81L(916)	Union; Johnson
Road o	ct Description: Inserting culvert liner on IL 148 in Williamson County; 2) S /; 3) SN 044-7073 located at MP 27.	N 091-7089 k	ocated 0.3 miles north of exit	
5306	Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.			
	PO Box 1555 Murphysboro, IL 62966 Phone: (618) 687-5500 Fax: (618) 684-9341 info@samron.com			\$271,925.00
5526	Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC			
	PO Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 7038 Highway 154 P.O. Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 Phone: (618) 924-1077 Fax: (618) 625-6516 bdorrissbcllc@hotmail.com			\$279,656.12
0392	Berger Excavating Contractors, In	с.		
	1205 Garland Rd. Wauconda, IL 60084 Phone: (847) 526-5457 Fax: (847) 526-4204 kberger@bergerexcavating.com			(No Bid)
1356	Davinroy Mechanical Contractor, I	nc.		
	44 Empire Drive Belleville, IL 62220 Phone: (618) 233-1112 Fax: (618) 233-1115 davinroymech@peaknet.net			(No Bid)
5550	E. T. Simonds Construction Comp	any		
	PO Box 2107 Carbondale, IL 62902 1500 N Oakland Ave PO Box 2107 Carbondale, IL 62902 Phone: (618) 457-8191 Fax: (618) 549-0131 mrodewald@etsimonds.com			(No Bid)

Illinois Department of Transportation

Run Time 09/21/2018 10:12 AM

Letting Item	: 038	Contract:	61C21	District: 1
Route:	SALT; CREEK; GREENWAY; TRAIL	Section:	12-P4000-01-BT	County: DuPage
	- ,	Project:	4TF1(406)	

Contract Description: Construction of a multi-use path from Butterfield Road to South of Butterfield Road in the City of Elmhurst.

3505	Lorig Construction Company	
	250 East Touhy Avenue Des Plaines, IL 60018 Phone: (847) 298-0360 Fax: (847) 298-2689 dlorig@lorigconstruction.com	\$650,954.33
0103	Alliance Contractors, Inc.	
	1166 Lake Avenue Woodstock, IL 60098 Phone: (815) 338-5900 Fax: (815) 338-9109 estimating@alliancecontractors.com	\$669,376.23
1552	Dunnet Bay Construction Company	
	115 N. Brandon Drive Glendale Heights, IL 60139 Phone: (630) 539-1200 Fax: (630) 539-4171 estimating@dunnetbay.net	\$702,626.17
4968	Rausch Infrastructure LLC	
	1111 East Touhy Ave Suite 120 Des Plaines, IL 60018 Phone: (708) 667-0165 Fax: (847) 813-9710 abrausch@riccllc.com	\$822,348.50
1216	Copenhaver Construction, Inc.	
	75 Koppie Dr Gilberts, IL 60136 Phone: (847) 428-6696 Fax: (847) 428-6798	\$1,298,250.30
0204	Areatha Construction Co., Inc.	
	410 E. North Avenue Streamwood, IL 60107 Phone: (630) 830-9853 Fax: (630) 830-9856	(No Bid)

Letting Item	: 038	Contract:	61C21	District: 1
Route:	SALT; CREEK; GREENWAY: TRAIL	Section:	12-P4000-01-BT	County: DuPage
		Project:	4TF1(406)	

Contract Description: Construction of a multi-use path from Butterfield Road to South of Butterfield Road in the City of Elmhurst.

3494	Lorusso Cement Contractors, INC.	
	1090 Carolina Drive West Chicago, IL 60185 Phone: (630) 231-9009 Fax: (630) 231-9083	(No Bid)
5737	St. Louis Bridge Construction Company	
	655 Landmark Drive Arnold, MO 63010 Phone: (636) 296-3300 Fax: (636) 296-7416	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	039	Contract:	61E00	District: 1
Route:	FAU 3795	Section:	12-00029-00-PV (ROCKDALE)	County: Will
		Project:	F1U5(430)	

Contract Description: Reconstruction of Moen Avenue from Mound Road to Larkin Avenue in the Village of Rockdale.

1750	P. T. Ferro Construction Co.	
	P.O. Box 156 Joliet, IL 60434 700 South Rowell Ave. Joliet, IL 60433 Phone: (815) 726-6284 Fax: (815) 726-5614 estimating@ptferro.com	\$4,999,401.22
1320	D. Construction, Inc.	
	1488 So. Broadway Coal City, IL 60416 Phone: (815) 634-2555 Fax: (815) 634-8748 bids@dconstruction.com	\$5,242,047.45
0392	Berger Excavating Contractors, Inc.	
	1205 Garland Rd. Wauconda, IL 60084 Phone: (847) 526-5457 Fax: (847) 526-4204 kberger@bergerexcavating.com	(No Bid)
1560	R. W. DUNTEMAN COMPANY	
	P. O. BOX 1129 ADDISON, IL 60101 600 S. LOMBARD RD. ADDISON, IL 60101 Phone: (630) 953-1500 Fax: (630) 932-0994 estimating@rwdco.com	(No Bid)
1950	Gallagher Asphalt Corporation	
	18100 South Indiana Avenue Thornton, IL 60476 Phone: (708) 877-7160 Fax: (708) 877-5222 ddarden@gallagherasphalt.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 039 Route: FAU 3795
 Contract:
 61E00
 District:
 1

 Section:
 12-00029-00-PV (ROCKDALE)
 County:
 Will

 Project:
 F1U5(430)
 F1U5(430)
 F1U5(430)

Contract Description: Reconstruction of Moen Avenue from Mound Road to Larkin Avenue in the Village of Rockdale.

6117 Austin Tyler Construction, Inc.

23343 S Ridge Road Elwood, IL 60421 Phone: (815) 726-1090 Fax: (815) 726-1171

(No Bid)

Letting Item:	040	Contract:	61E88	District: 1
Route:	MONTGOMRY; ROAD	Section:	16-00311-00-BT (AURORA)	County: DuPage
		Project:	C9A7(314)	

Contract Description: Construction of a shared use path adjacent to Montgomery Road from Waubonsie Creek Trail to Middlebury Drive in the City of Aurora.

1320	D. Construction, Inc.	
	1488 So. Broadway Coal City, IL 60416 Phone: (815) 634-2555 Fax: (815) 634-8748 bids@dconstruction.com	\$588,452.41
3315	A Lamp Concrete Contractors, Inc.	
	1900 Wright Blvd Schaumburg, IL 60193 Phone: 847891600 jmoyer@alampconcrete.com	\$649,345.00
3069	K-Five Construction Corporation	
	999 Oakmont Plaza Drive Suite 200 Westmont, IL 60559 Phone: (630) 257-5600 Fax: (630) 257-6788 estimating@k-five.net	\$657,058.16
3494	Lorusso Cement Contractors, INC.	
	1090 Carolina Drive West Chicago, IL 60185 Phone: (630) 231-9009 Fax: (630) 231-9083	\$695,620.79
3356	Landmark Contractors, Inc.	
	11916 W. Main St. Huntley, IL 60142 Phone: (847) 669-5474 Fax: (847) 669-5529	\$716,189.02
0103	Alliance Contractors, Inc.	
	1166 Lake Avenue Woodstock, IL 60098 Phone: (815) 338-5900 Fax: (815) 338-9109 estimating@alliancecontractors.com	\$755,017.92

Letting Item:	: 040	Contract:	61E88	District: 1
Route:	MONTGOMRY; ROAD	Section:	16-00311-00-BT (AURORA)	County: DuPage
		Project:	C9A7(314)	

Contract Description: Construction of a shared use path adjacent to Montgomery Road from Waubonsie Creek Trail to Middlebury Drive in the City of Aurora.

1216	Copenhaver Construction, Inc.	
	75 Koppie Dr Gilberts, IL 60136 Phone: (847) 428-6696 Fax: (847) 428-6798	\$809,711.40
1188	Construction Management Corp. of America	
	5106 Walnut Avenue Downers Grove, IL 60515 Phone: (630) 963-4017 Fax: (630) 963-2798 tbriggs@cmcofam.net	\$833,602.70
0204	Areatha Construction Co., Inc.	
	410 E. North Avenue Streamwood, IL 60107 Phone: (630) 830-9853 Fax: (630) 830-9856	(No Bid)
0392	Berger Excavating Contractors, Inc.	
	1205 Garland Rd. Wauconda, IL 60084 Phone: (847) 526-5457 Fax: (847) 526-4204 kberger@bergerexcavating.com	(No Bid)
1560	R. W. DUNTEMAN COMPANY	
	P. O. BOX 1129 ADDISON, IL 60101 600 S. LOMBARD RD. ADDISON, IL 60101 Phone: (630) 953-1500 Fax: (630) 932-0994 estimating@rwdco.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	041
Route:	FAP 361; FAU 3810

 Contract:
 61E98

 Section:
 18-00285-02-RS

 Project:
 N859(116)

District: 1 County: DuPage

Contract Description: Roadway resurfacing and sidewalk installation on Greenbrook Boulevard from County Farm Road to Lake Street.

3020	J. A. Johnson Paving Company	
	1025 E. ADDISON COURT ARLINGTON HEIGHTS, IL 60005 Phone: (847) 439-2025 Fax: (847) 439-2084	\$885,885.00
4813	Plote Construction, Inc.	
	1100 Brandt Drive Hoffman Estates, IL 60192 Phone: (847) 695-9300 Fax: (847) 695-9317 bids@plote.com	\$898,437.78
0231	Arrow Road Construction Co.	
	3401 S. Busse Road P.O. Box 334 Mt. Prospect, IL 60056 3401 S. Busse Road Mt. Prospect, IL 60056 Phone: (847) 437-0700 Fax: (847) 437-6887	\$907,250.68
3315	A Lamp Concrete Contractors, Inc.	
	1900 Wright Blvd Schaumburg, IL 60193 Phone: 847891600 jmoyer@alampconcrete.com	\$914,123.88
1560	R. W. DUNTEMAN COMPANY	
	P. O. BOX 1129 ADDISON, IL 60101 600 S. LOMBARD RD. ADDISON, IL 60101 Phone: (630) 953-1500 Fax: (630) 932-0994 estimating@rwdco.com	\$943,546.22
0103	Alliance Contractors, Inc.	
	1166 Lake Avenue Woodstock, IL 60098 Phone: (815) 338-5900 Fax: (815) 338-9109 estimating@alliancecontractors.com	(No Bid)

 Letting Item:
 041

 Route:
 FAP 361; FAU 3810

Contract: 61E98 Section: 18-00285-02-RS Project: N859(116) District: 1 County: DuPage

Contract Description: Roadway resurfacing and sidewalk installation on Greenbrook Boulevard from County Farm Road to Lake Street.

1188 Construction Management Corp. of America

5106 Walnut Avenue Downers Grove, IL 60515 Phone: (630) 963-4017 Fax: (630) 963-2798 tbriggs@cmcofam.net

(No Bid)

Letting Item: 042 Route: FAU 5821 Contract: 85644 Section: 15-00191-00-RS (ROCK ISLAND) Project: WAIU(248) District: 2 County: Rock Island

Contract Description: Resurface 38th Street from 7th Avenue to Blackhawk Road in the City of Rock Island.

0593	Brandt Construction Co.	
	700 4th Street West Milan, IL 61264 Phone: (309) 787-4644 Fax: (309) 787-6344 tbrandt@brandtconstructionco.com	\$2,330,106.40
6035	Tri-City Blacktop, Inc.	
	425 South Devils Glen Road Bettendorf, IA 52722 Phone: (563) 359-7125 Fax: (563) 359-3491 terryt@tcblacktop.com	\$2,561,601.22
6210	Valley Construction Co.	
	3610 78 Avenue West P.O. Box 2020 Rock Island, IL 61201 3610 78 Avenue West Rock Island, IL 61201 Phone: (309) 787-0292 Fax: (309) 787-7048 estimating@valleyconstruction.com	\$2,597,996.40
3810	McCarthy Improvement Company	
	5401 Victoria Avenue Davenport, IA 52807 Phone: (563) 359-0321 Fax: (563) 344-3717 estimating@mccarthyimprovement.com	\$2,791,421.95

Letting Item:	043
Route:	MULTI-USE; TRAIL

 Contract:
 93711

 Section:
 16-P4003-04-BT

 Project:
 2M1D(727)

District: 6 County: Adams

Contract Description: Construction of a multi-use trail from 18th Street to 24th Street along Cedar Creek in Quincy.

1232	County Contractors, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 3522 Quincy, IL 62305 1228 East 1350th Street Quincy, IL 62305 Phone: (217) 885-3550 Fax: (217) 885-3575 chris@countycontractorsinc.com	\$2,400,671.40
3391	Laverdiere Construction, Inc.	
	4055 W Jackson St Macomb, IL 61455 Phone: (309) 837-1258 Fax: (309) 833-4993 mlynn@lavconinc.com	\$2,489,677.60
2323	Halverson Construction Co., Inc.	
	620 N. 19th St. Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 753-0027 Fax: (217) 753-1904 hbid@halversonconstruction.com	\$2,709,375.14
5310	Sangamo Construction Company	
	2100 East Moffat St Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 544-9871 Fax: (217) 544-9873 office@sangamo.net	\$2,819,214.07
0620	R. L. Brink Corp.	
	4400 No. 24th Street Quincy, IL 62305 Phone: (217) 222-2760 Fax: (217) 222-2761 rlbrink2@adams.net	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 043 Route: MULTI-USE; TRAIL Contract: 93711 Section: 16-P4003-04-BT Project: 2M1D(727) District: 6 County: Adams

Contract Description: Construction of a multi-use trail from 18th Street to 24th Street along Cedar Creek in Quincy.

4741	Phoenix Corporation of the Quad Cities	
	PO Box 445 Rapids City, IL 61278 1006 Rosehill Rd Port Byron, IL 61275 Phone: (309) 523-3687 Fax: (309) 523-3752 mdecap@phoenixcorp.org	(No Bid)
5006	Rees Construction Company of Quincy and Diamond Construction Company JV	
	517 Kentucky Quincy, IL 62301 PO Box 646 Quincy, IL 62306	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	044	Contract:	93720	District: 6
Route:	FAU 8177	Section:	17-00122-00-RS 17-00127-00- RS	County: Morgan
		Project:	DHHV(427)	

Contract Description: Mill and surface East Michigan Avenue from South Main Street to Hardin Avenue in the City of Jacksonville.

6245	K. E. Vas Company	
	PO Box 190	\$657,302.25
	Jacksonville, IL 62651	
	311 Moeller Rd.	
	Jacksonville, IL 62650	
	Phone: (217) 245-9617	
	Fax: (217) 243-6576	
	kevasco@irtc.net	
2825	Illinois Valley Paving, a div of UCM, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 13420	\$684,775.19
	Springfield, IL 62791	+ · ,· · - · · -
	3151 Robbins Road	
	Springfield, IL 62704	
	Phone: (217) 546-6192	
	Fax: (217) 546-1904	
	IVP@ucm.biz	
	-	

Letting Item: 045 Route: CH 5 Contract: 99609 Section: 16-00097-00-RS Project: JA42(693) District: 9 County: Massac

Contract Description: Resurface Grand Chain Road from CH 4 North Junction to CH 4 South Junction.

5550	E. T. Simonds Construction Company	
	PO Box 2107 Carbondale, IL 62902 1500 N Oakland Ave PO Box 2107 Carbondale, IL 62902 Phone: (618) 457-8191 Fax: (618) 549-0131 mrodewald@etsimonds.com	\$335,393.96
5609	Southern Illinois Asphalt Co., Inc.	
	1003 Aspen St. Marion, IL 62959 Phone: (618) 998-1615 Fax: (618) 998-1744 jmcphail@deltacos.com	\$357,797.59

Letting Item: 046 Route: FAU 1642 Contract: 61F02 Section: 15-00054-00-TL CHICAGO RIDGE Project: 3XHK(749) District: 1 County: Cook

Contract Description: Traffic signal installation at 99th Street and Ridgeland Avenue in the Village of Chicago Ridge.

1040	City Lights, Ltd.	
	9993 Virginia Avenue Chicago Ridge, IL 60415 Phone: (773) 626-9162 Fax: (773) 626-5415 cheryl@citylightsltd.com	\$578,284.56
2550	H & H ELECTRIC CO.	
	2830 Commerce Street Franklin Park, IL 60131 Phone: (708) 878-2445 Fax: (708) 453-2851 Iouie.veneziano@hh-electric.com	\$603,694.52
2475	Hecker and Company, Inc.	
	250 Industrial Lane Wheeling, IL 60090 Phone: (847) 459-9222 Fax: (847) 459-9250 dan@heckerco.com	\$620,030.45
3948	Meade Inc.	
	9550 W. 55th Street Suite A McCook, IL 60525 Phone: (708) 588-2500 Fax: (708) 588-2501 dal@meade100.com	\$651,780.69
1382	Davis Concrete Construction Co.	
	11244 W Manhattan Monee Rd Monee, IL 60449 Phone: (708) 388-1100 Fax: (708) 388-9642	(No Bid)
2657	Home Towne Electric, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 863 Lake Villa, IL 60046 35220 Rt 83 Lake Villa, IL 60046 Phone: (847) 223-2800 Fax: (847) 223-7577	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 046 Route: FAU 1642 Contract: 61F02 Section: 15-00054-00-TL CHICAGO RIDGE Project: 3XHK(749) District: 1 County: Cook

Contract Description: Traffic signal installation at 99th Street and Ridgeland Avenue in the Village of Chicago Ridge.

5949 Thorne Electric, Inc.

P.O. Box 321 Wheaton, IL 60187 26W501 St. Charles Rd. Carol Stream, IL 60188 Phone: (630) 668-4853 Fax: (630) 668-4879

(No Bid)

Letting Item: 047 Route: CH 5 Contract: 97675 Section: 13-00400-00-BR Project: 03JC(122) District: 8 County: Marion

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying CH 5 over Jim's Creek, located 4.0 miles southeast of Patoka.

5526	Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC	
	PO Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 7038 Highway 154 P.O. Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 Phone: (618) 924-1077 Fax: (618) 625-6516 bdorrissbcllc@hotmail.com	\$790,283.60
1439	Depew and Owen Builders, Inc.	
	PO Box 1252 Centralia, IL 62801 301 N. Oak Street Centralia, IL 62801 Phone: (618) 532-1160 ronnie@depewandowen.com	\$858,488.00
5802	Stutz Excavating, Inc.	
	3837 Fosterburg Road Alton, IL 62002 Phone: (618) 259-2485	\$911,728.95
3085	Keeley & Sons, Inc.	
	6303 Collinsville Road East St. Louis, IL 62201 Phone: (618) 271-7470 Fax: (618) 271-0830 Brian.Lurk@keeleyandsons.com	\$1,126,183.92
3157	The Kilian Corporation	
	P.O. Box A Mascoutah, IL 62258 608 South Independence Street Mascoutah, IL 62258 Phone: (618) 566-2000 Fax: (618) 566-2314 sharon.weier@kiliancorp.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 047 Route: CH 5
 Contract:
 97675

 Section:
 13-00400-00-BR

 Project:
 03JC(122)

District: 8 County: Marion

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying CH 5 over Jim's Creek, located 4.0 miles southeast of Patoka.

5463	Shores Builders, Inc.	
	1154 Schwartz Road Centralia, IL 62801 Phone: (618) 532-3997	(No Bid)
	Fax: (618) 532-9719 jheltsley@shoresbuilders.com	
5737	St. Louis Bridge Construction Company	
	655 Landmark Drive	(No Bid)
	Arnold, MO 63010	(
	Phone: (636) 296-3300	
	Fax: (636) 296-7416	

Letting Item: 048		Contract:	97676	District: 8
Route:	TR 82	Section:	08-08127-00-BR	County: Bond
		Project:	1J8U(505)	

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying TR 82 over Elm Point Branch, located 2.0 miles south of Panama.

1439	Depew and Owen Builders, Inc.	
	PO Box 1252 Centralia, IL 62801 301 N. Oak Street Centralia, IL 62801 Phone: (618) 532-1160 ronnie@depewandowen.com	\$638,688.00
3108	Keller Construction, Inc.	
	22 Illini Drive Glen Carbon, IL 62034 Phone: (618) 656-0033 Fax: (618) 656-7134	\$652,017.57
4928	RCS Construction, Inc.	
	960 E. Airline Drive East Alton, IL 62024 Phone: (618) 254-3816 Fax: (618) 254-3841 julie@rcs-construction.com	\$722,902.71
3163	Kinney Contractors, Inc.	
	19342 E. Frontage Rd. Raymond, IL 62560 Phone: (217) 229-3322 Fax: (217) 229-3609 kinney@roadbuilder.net	\$753,953.65
4757	Plocher Construction Company, Inc.	
	2808 Thole-Plocher Road Highland, IL 62249 Phone: (618) 654-9408 Fax: (618) 654-6454 bids@plocherco.com	\$785,500.00
3085	Keeley & Sons, Inc.	
	6303 Collinsville Road East St. Louis, IL 62201 Phone: (618) 271-7470 Fax: (618) 271-0830 Brian.Lurk@keeleyandsons.com	\$792,283.58

Letting Item:	048	Contract:	97676	District: 8
Route:	TR 82	Section:	08-08127-00-BR	County: Bond
		Project:	1J8U(505)	

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying TR 82 over Elm Point Branch, located 2.0 miles south of Panama.

0338	Baxmeyer Construction, Inc.	
	1034 Floraville Road Waterloo, IL 62298 Phone: (618) 939-3000 Fax: (618) 939-4299	(No Bid)
3157	The Kilian Corporation	
	P.O. Box A Mascoutah, IL 62258 608 South Independence Street Mascoutah, IL 62258 Phone: (618) 566-2000 Fax: (618) 566-2314 sharon.weier@kiliancorp.com	(No Bid)
5737	St. Louis Bridge Construction Company	
	655 Landmark Drive Arnold, MO 63010 Phone: (636) 296-3300 Fax: (636) 296-7416	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	049	Contract:	46501	District:	3
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	D-3 REFLECTOR REPL 19-06	County:	Ford; Livingston; Iroquois
		Project:			

Contract Description: Removal and replacement of raised reflective pavement markers and replacement reflectors.

5091	RoadSafe Traffic Systems, Inc.	
	12225 Disk Drive Romeoville, IL 60446 Phone: (815) 372-2300 Fax: (815) 372-3233 bseeman@roadsafetraffic.com	\$257,475.01
3689	Marking Specialists Corporation	
	214 Crystal Street Suite C Cary, IL 60013 Phone: (847) 462-0799 Fax: (847) 462-0929 rob@markingspecialists.net	\$314,893.25
0031	A. C. Pavement Striping Co.	
	695 Church Road Elgin, IL 60123 Phone: (847) 214-9500 Fax: (847) 214-9078 wbrinati@acpavement.net	(No Bid)
6024	STF, LLC d/b/a Traffic Control Company	
	601 8TH STREET VALLEY PARK, MO 63088 16961 STATE STREET SOUTH HOLLAND, IL 60473 Phone: (636) 225-7800 Fax: (636) 225-3460 bjp@trafficcontrolcompany.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	050	Contract:	46502	District: 2
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	D 2 REFLECTOR REPL 19-07	County: Various
		Project:		

Contract Description: Removing and Replacing Reflectors, removing and replacing damaged raised reflective pavement marker casting within the limits shown.

5091	RoadSafe Traffic Systems, Inc.	
	12225 Disk Drive Romeoville, IL 60446 Phone: (815) 372-2300 Fax: (815) 372-3233 bseeman@roadsafetraffic.com	\$623,968.01
3689	Marking Specialists Corporation	
	214 Crystal Street Suite C Cary, IL 60013 Phone: (847) 462-0799 Fax: (847) 462-0929 rob@markingspecialists.net	\$814,496.50
0031	A. C. Pavement Striping Co.	
	695 Church Road Elgin, IL 60123 Phone: (847) 214-9500 Fax: (847) 214-9078 wbrinati@acpavement.net	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 01W Route: Contract: FR442 Section: Project: FR-442 District: 1 County: Cook

Contract Description: Modification to the golf course watering pump station at the Tam O'Shanter Golf Course in Niles, Illinois. Work includes replacing the pump station wet well, the screening wet well, relocating the intake, modification to the existing pumps and all appurtenant work. DBE Percentage 7%

3702	Martam Construction Incorporated	
	1200 Gasket Dr Elgin, IL 60120 Phone: (847) 608-6800 Fax: (847) 608-6804	\$364,132.50
3243	Kovilic Construction Company, Inc.	
	PO Box 939 Franklin Park, IL 60131-0939 3721 N. Carnation St. Franklin Park, IL 60131-0939 Phone: (847) 671-4978	\$382,271.00
4968	Rausch Infrastructure LLC	
	1111 East Touhy Ave Suite 120 Des Plaines, IL 60018 Phone: (708) 667-0165 Fax: (847) 813-9710 abrausch@riccllc.com	\$538,115.10
0733	John Burns Construction Company	
	17601 Southwest Highway Orland Park, IL 60467 Phone: (708) 326-3406 Fax: (708) 326-3499 arenteria@jbcco.com	(No Bid)