At this time and prior to a post-letting review, the following projects are within a reasonable approximation of the Estimate.

YES YES YES YES YES NO No bids

1	NO	44
2	YES	45
3	YES	46
4	NO	47
5	YES	48
6	YES	49
8	NO	50
9	YES	51
10	NO	
11	YES	
12	YES	
13	WDN	
14	YES	
15	YES	
16	NO	
17	WDN	
18	WDN	
19	YES	
20	YES	
21	YES	
22	YES	
23	NO	
24	NO	
25	DEL	
26	YES	
27	NO	
29	YES	
30	NO	
31	YES	
32	NO	
33	YES	
34	YES	
35	NO	
36	NO	
37	YES	
38	NO	
39	NO	
40	YES	
41	NO	
42	NO	
43	YES	

Letting Item: 001		Contract:	46530	District: 2
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	D2 REFLECTOR REPL 20-18	County: Various
		Project:		

Contract Description: Removing and replacing reflectors and raised reflective pavement marker castings.

5091	RoadSafe Traffic Systems, Inc.	
	12225 Disk Drive Romeoville, IL 60446 Phone: (815) 372-2300 Fax: (815) 927-0110 bseeman@roadsafetraffic.com	\$1,054,784.00
4588	P & P Construction Co.	
	1132 East Lincoln Riverton, IL 62561 Phone: (217) 629-8544 Fax: (217) 629-8547 ppconst@casscomm.com	\$1,061,333.15
3689	Marking Specialists Corporation	
	114 High Road Unit 1 Cary, IL 60013 Phone: (847) 462-0799 Fax: (847) 462-0929 rob@markingspecialists.net	\$1,288,208.00
4837	Precision Pavement Markings Inc.	
	PO Box 705 Elgin, IL 60121 955 Grace Street Elgin, IL 60120 Phone: (847) 931-9092 Fax: (847) 637-0867 fred@precisionpavement.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	002	Contract:	61F79	District: 1
Route:	FAU 2673	Section:	15-00052-00-SW(PROSPECT HGHTS)	County: Cook
		Project:	B0GM(434)	

Contract Description: Sidewalk construction on Schoenbeck Road from Willow Road to Camp McDonald Road in the City of Prospect Heights.

0103	Alliance Contractors, Inc.	
	1166 Lake Avenue Woodstock, IL 60098 Phone: (815) 338-5900 Fax: (815) 338-9109 estimating@alliancecontractors.com	\$377,041.29
3315	A Lamp Concrete Contractors, Inc.	
	1900 Wright Blvd Schaumburg, IL 60193 Phone: 847891600 estimating@alampconcrete.com	\$498,339.45
1216	Copenhaver Construction, Inc.	
	75 Koppie Dr Gilberts, IL 60136 Phone: (847) 428-6696 Fax: (847) 428-6798 copenhaverinc@yahoo.com	\$505,585.64
6051	Triggi Construction, Inc.	
	POB 235 West Chicago, IL 60186 1975 Powis Road West Chicago, IL 60185 Phone: (630) 584-4490 Fax: (630) 584-0271	\$535,974.00
5832	Sumit Construction Co., Inc.	
	4150 W. Wrightwood Ave Chicago, IL 60639 Phone: (773) 276-4600 Fax: (773) 276-4644	\$602,332.05
1382	Davis Concrete Construction Co.	
	11244 W Manhattan Monee Rd Monee, IL 60449 Phone: (708) 388-1100 Fax: (708) 388-9642	(No Bid)

 Letting Item:
 003
 Contract:
 62C21
 District:
 1

 Route:
 FAP 330
 Section:
 2016-008TS&I
 County:
 Cook

 Project:
 Project:
 County:
 Cook
 County:
 Cook

Contract Description: Guardrail improvements along US 12/20/45 from 63rd Street to Creek Road. Project includes traffic signal modernization at US 45 and 123rd Street.

3526	Lyons Electric Company, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 749 LaGrange, IL 60525 650 East Elm Avenue LaGrange, IL 60525 Phone: (708) 588-6800 Fax: (708) 588-6805	\$515,400.00
2475	Hecker and Company, Inc.	
	250 Industrial Lane Wheeling, IL 60090 Phone: (847) 459-9222 Fax: (847) 459-9250 dan@heckerco.com	\$515,699.85
2550	H & H ELECTRIC CO.	
	2830 Commerce Street Franklin Park, IL 60131 Phone: (708) 878-2445 Fax: (708) 453-2851 Iouie.veneziano@hh-electric.com	\$547,684.19
0733	John Burns Construction Company	
	17601 Southwest Highway Orland Park, IL 60467 Phone: (708) 326-3406 Fax: (708) 326-3499 arenteria@jbcco.com	(No Bid)
1040	City Lights, Ltd.	
	9993 Virginia Avenue Chicago Ridge, IL 60415 Phone: (773) 626-9162 Fax: (773) 626-5415 cheryl@citylightsltd.com	(No Bid)
1647	Electric Conduit Construction	
	816 Hicks Drive Elburn, IL 60119	(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

Letting Item: 003 Route: FAP 330 Contract: 62C21 Section: 2016-008TS&I Project: District: 1 County: Cook

Contract Description: Guardrail improvements along US 12/20/45 from 63rd Street to Creek Road. Project includes traffic signal modernization at US 45 and 123rd Street.

2657	Home Towne Electric, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 863 Lake Villa, IL 60046 35220 Rt 83 Lake Villa, IL 60046 Phone: (847) 223-2800 Fax: (847) 223-7577	(No Bid)
5832	Sumit Construction Co., Inc.	
	4150 W. Wrightwood Ave Chicago, IL 60639 Phone: (773) 276-4600 Fax: (773) 276-4644	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	004	Contract:	62H91	District: 1
Route:	FAP 333	Section:	2019-011-T	County: Lake
		Project:		

Contract Description: Drain tile repair project, includes replacement of 18" clay pipe with 24" reinforced concrete pipe in unincorporated Avon Township on IL 120, just east of Wilson Road

3353	Lion Construction 1, LLC	
	2598 S. 14000 E. Road Pembroke Twp, IL 60958 Phone: (815) 944-5788 Fax: (815) 944-5787 Iajobiemosley@att.net	\$497,411.00
3984	Meru Corporation	
	P. O. Box 480333 Niles, IL 60714 8436 W. Carol Street Niles, IL 60714 Phone: (847) 759-0430 Fax: (847) 759-0431 nirav@merucorporation.com	(No Bid)
4156	Misfits Construction Company	
	233 South Wacker Drive Suite 8400 Chicago, IL 60606 Phone: (312) 420-5041	(No Bid)

 Letting Item:
 005

 Route:
 FAP 565

Contract: 64N87 Section: D2 RS 2020-1 Project: District: 2 County: Whiteside

Contract Description: Cold milling and HMA resurfacing on IL 136 from 0.1 mile west of 4th Street to east of 6th Street in Fulton.

1045	Civil Constructors, Inc.	
	PO Box 750 Freeport, IL 61032 2283 Bus Hwy 20 East Freeport, IL 61032 Phone: (815) 235-2200 Fax: (815) 235-2219 civilestimating@civilinc.com	\$183,348.77
6210	Valley Construction Co.	
	3610 78 Avenue West Rock Island, IL 61201 Phone: (309) 787-0292 Fax: (309) 787-7048 estimating@valleyconstruction.com	\$236,419.20
3706	Martin & Company Excavating	
	P.O. Box 443 Oregon, IL 61061 2456 E. Pleasant Grove Road Oregon, IL 61061 Phone: (815) 732-2422 Fax: (815) 732-2092	\$238,589.05
0593	Brandt Construction Co.	
	700 4th Street West Milan, IL 61264 Phone: (309) 787-4644 Fax: (309) 787-6344 tbrandt@brandtconstructionco.com	\$253,300.00
3810	McCarthy Improvement Company	
	5401 Victoria Avenue Davenport, IA 52807 Phone: (563) 359-0321 Fax: (563) 344-3717 estimating@mccarthyimprovement.com	\$330,002.71

Letting Item:	: 006	Contract:	64N89	District: 2
Route:	FAP 301	Section:	D2 RS 2020-2	County: Winnebago
		Project:		

Contract Description: Cold milling and HMA resurfacing on US 20, 0.2 mile east and west of Winnebago Road.

5112	Rock Road Companies, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 1818 Janesville, WI 53547 301 W B-R Townline Road Janesville, WI 53546 Phone: (608) 752-8944 Fax: (608) 365-1113 bids@rockroads.com	\$338,444.23
0958	William Charles Construction Company, LLC	
	P.O. Box 2071 Loves Park, IL 61130 833 Featherstone Road Rockford, IL 61107 Phone: (815) 654-4700 Fax: (815) 654-4736 estimating@williamcharlesconstruction.com	\$368,604.58
1305	Curran Contracting Company	
	286 Memorial Court Crystal Lake, IL 60014 Phone: (815) 455-5100 Fax: (815) 455-7894 estimating@currancontracting.com	\$384,384.00
3706	Martin & Company Excavating	
	P.O. Box 443 Oregon, IL 61061 2456 E. Pleasant Grove Road Oregon, IL 61061 Phone: (815) 732-2422 Fax: (815) 732-2092	\$523,065.21

Letting Item	: 008	Contract:	66A92	District: 3
Route:	FAP 646	Section:	(122)RS-5	County: Bureau
		Project:	STPN8C1(095)	

Contract Description: 6.03 miles of 3P milling and resurfacing on IL 40 from the Burlington Northern Santa Fe Railroad south of Buda to the Stark County line. Includes approach work on SN 006-0145, guardrail with shoulder stabilization, aggregate ditch checks, intermittent resurfacing, shoulder stone, pavement marking and raised reflectors.

0049	Advanced Asphalt Company	
	PO Box 234 Princeton, IL 61356 308 W Railroad Ave Princeton, IL 61356 Phone: (815) 872-9911 Fax: (815) 872-0569 bbruins@advasphalt.biz	\$3,084,436.52
3810	McCarthy Improvement Company	
	5401 Victoria Avenue Davenport, IA 52807 Phone: (563) 359-0321 Fax: (563) 344-3717 estimating@mccarthyimprovement.com	\$3,523,777.33
0593	Brandt Construction Co.	
	700 4th Street West Milan, IL 61264 Phone: (309) 787-4644 Fax: (309) 787-6344 tbrandt@brandtconstructionco.com	(No Bid)
3706	Martin & Company Excavating	
	P.O. Box 443 Oregon, IL 61061 2456 E. Pleasant Grove Road Oregon, IL 61061 Phone: (815) 732-2422 Fax: (815) 732-2092	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	009	Contract:	66H92	District:	3
Route:	FAP 607	Section:	(129)SFY	County:	Kendall
		Project:	HSIPMNEG(054)		

Contract Description: Installation of flashing red and yellow beacons at each approach to the intersection of US 52 and Grove Road.

6242	Van-Mack Electric Co.	
	1026 Moen Avenue Rockdale, IL 60436 Phone: (815) 725-7883 Fax: (815) 725-7888 vanmackelectric@aol.com	\$59,096.00
1320	D. Construction, Inc.	
	1488 So. Broadway Coal City, IL 60416 Phone: (815) 634-2555 Fax: (815) 634-8748 bids@dconstruction.com	\$98,824.00
2550	H & H ELECTRIC CO.	
	2830 Commerce Street Franklin Park, IL 60131 Phone: (708) 878-2445 Fax: (708) 453-2851 Iouie.veneziano@hh-electric.com	(No Bid)
2657	Home Towne Electric, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 863 Lake Villa, IL 60046 35220 Rt 83 Lake Villa, IL 60046 Phone: (847) 223-2800 Fax: (847) 223-7577	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	010
Route:	FAP 71; FAS 340

Contract: 66J58 Section: (108,109)CR Project: District: 3 County: Ford

Contract Description: Removal and replacement of an 18" diameter pipe culvert south of the railroad tracks in Roberts and a and a 2' x 1.5'concrete box culvert on the north side of the 1300N Rd intersection with IL 115.

5564	G. M. Sipes Construction, Inc.	
	P.O. BOX 109 RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 503 E. ADAMS ST RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 Phone: (217) 322-6543 Fax: (217) 322-4712 support@gmsipes.com	\$131,005.00
3353	Lion Construction 1, LLC 2598 S. 14000 E. Road Pembroke Twp, IL 60958 Phone: (815) 944-5788 Fax: (815) 944-5787 Iajobiemosley@att.net	\$225,502.28
4156	Misfits Construction Company	
	233 South Wacker Drive Suite 8400 Chicago, IL 60606 Phone: (312) 420-5041	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	011	Contract:	66K05	District:	3
Route:	FAS 1522	Section:	(31X)RS-1 & (32)RS-3	County:	Ford
		Project:	STPSXWD(442)		

Contract Description: 3.4 miles of milling, resurfacting and intermittent patching on US 45 from Dawn Avenue in Paxton to the Champaign County line.

2880	Iroquois Paving Corporation	
	PO Box 466 Watseka, IL 60970 1889 E US Hwy 24 PO Box 466 Watseka, IL 60970 Phone: (815) 432-5211 Fax: (815) 432-5234 estimating@iroqpavcorp.com	\$1,379,136.44
1250	Cross Construction, Inc.	
	3615 N Countryview Rd Urbana, IL 61802 Phone: (217) 367-3526 Fax: (217) 337-3066 closchen@crossconstructioncorp.com	\$1,503,772.51

Letting Item:	: 012	Contract:	66K25	District:	3
Route:	FAI 55	Section:	(32-1)I&RS-3	County:	Grundy
		Project:			

Contract Description: 0.9 miles of milling and resurfacing on both NB and SB lanes of I-55 at MP 232.6, milling and resurfacing Reed Road interchange ramps, and building two PCC crosssovers.

1320	D. Construction, Inc.	
	1488 So. Broadway Coal City, IL 60416 Phone: (815) 634-2555 Fax: (815) 634-8748 bids@dconstruction.com	\$3,956,039.96
1950	Gallagher Asphalt Corporation	
	18100 South Indiana Avenue Thornton, IL 60476 Phone: (708) 877-7160 Fax: (708) 877-5222 jkolmodin@gallagherasphalt.com	\$4,476,377.77
1560	R. W. DUNTEMAN COMPANY	
	P. O. BOX 1129 ADDISON, IL 60101 600 S. LOMBARD RD. ADDISON, IL 60101 Phone: (630) 953-1500 Fax: (630) 932-0994 estimating@rwdco.com	(No Bid)
1750	P. T. Ferro Construction Co.	
	P.O. Box 156 Joliet, IL 60434 700 South Rowell Ave. Joliet, IL 60433 Phone: (815) 726-6284 Fax: (815) 726-5614 estimating@ptferro.com	(No Bid)
3069	K-Five Construction Corporation	
	999 Oakmont Plaza Drive Suite 200 Westmont, IL 60559 Phone: (630) 257-5600 Fax: (630) 257-6788 estimating@k-five.net	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 012 Route: FAI 55 Contract: 66K25 Section: (32-1)I&RS-3 Project: District: 3 County: Grundy

Contract Description: 0.9 miles of milling and resurfacing on both NB and SB lanes of I-55 at MP 232.6, milling and resurfacing Reed Road interchange ramps, and building two PCC crosssovers.

6117 Austin Tyler Construction, Inc.

23343 S Ridge Road Elwood, IL 60421 Phone: (815) 726-1090 Fax: (815) 726-1171 info@austin-tyler.com

(No Bid)

Letting Item: 013	Withdrawn	Contract: 68758	District: 4
Route:		Section:	County: Knox
		Project:	

Contract Description: Replacement of structure carrying IL 78 over kickapoo creek and replacement of a box culvert.

No Electronic Bids

No Authorized Bidders

Letting Item:	014	Contract:	68E92	District: 4
Route:	FAP 669; FAP 673	Section:	(101,11,12,104X)PP	County: Tazewell
		Project:		

Contract Description: Patching on IL 29/IL IL/8 116/US 24 from Wesley Rd. in Creve Coeur to camp street in East Peoria.

1284	R. A. Cullinan and Son, a div of UCM, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 166 Tremont, IL 61568 121 West Park Street Tremont, IL 61568 Phone: (309) 925-2711 Fax: (309) 925-7131 RACullinan@UCM.biz	\$316,579.33
5564	G. M. Sipes Construction, Inc.	
	P.O. BOX 109 RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 503 E. ADAMS ST RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 Phone: (217) 322-6543 Fax: (217) 322-4712 support@gmsipes.com	(No Bid)
5672	Stark Excavating, Inc.	
	1805 W Washington St. Bloomington, IL 61701 Phone: (309) 828-5034 Fax: (309) 829-3897 estimating@starkcompanies.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 015		Contract:	68F06	District: 4
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	D4 ROUT & SEAL 2020	County: Various
		Project:	STP71EF(234)	

Contract Description: Rout and seal at various locations within the western ha;f of district four.

1882	Freehill Asphalt, Inc.	
	PO Box 154 Watseka, IL 60970 103 Yount Ave Watseka, IL 60970 Phone: (815) 432-5438 Fax: (815) 432-5439 thomasfreehill@sbcglobal.net	\$523,663.60
1443	Denler, Inc.	
	20502 S Cherry Hill Rd Joliet, IL 60433 Phone: (708) 479-5005 Fax: (708) 479-5015 info@denlerinc.com	\$597,193.30
1175	Complete Asphalt Service Co.	
	PO Box 457 Pittsfield, IL 62363 1601 Kamar Drive Pittsfield, IL 62363 Phone: (217) 285-6099 Fax: (217) 285-6094 casco3@frontier.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 016		Contract:	68F07	District: 4
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	D4 ROUT & SEAL 2020-1	County: Various
		Project:	STP68KL(236)	

Contract Description: Rout and seal various locations within the eastern half of District 4

1443	Denler, Inc.	
	20502 S Cherry Hill Rd Joliet, IL 60433 Phone: (708) 479-5005 Fax: (708) 479-5015 info@denlerinc.com	\$543,627.98
1175	Complete Asphalt Service Co.	
	PO Box 457 Pittsfield, IL 62363 1601 Kamar Drive Pittsfield, IL 62363 Phone: (217) 285-6099 Fax: (217) 285-6094 casco3@frontier.com	(No Bid)
1882	Freehill Asphalt, Inc.	
	PO Box 154 Watseka, IL 60970 103 Yount Ave Watseka, IL 60970 Phone: (815) 432-5438 Fax: (815) 432-5439 thomasfreehill@sbcglobal.net	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 017	Withdrawn	Contract: 70B53	District: 5
Route:		Section:	County: Champaign
		Project:	

Contract Description: 1.533 miles of safety improvements on US 150/University Ave. from Wright St. to Cunningham Ave. in Urbana.

No Electronic Bids

No Authorized Bidders

Letting Item: 018	Withdrawn	Contract: 72J45	District: 6
Route:		Section:	County: Hancock
		Project:	

Contract Description: Replacing the bridge carrying IL96 over Sheridan Creek, 0.9 miles south of Nauvoo (SN 034-0020).

No Electronic Bids

No Authorized Bidders

Letting Item: 019		Contract:	72K06	District: 6
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	D6 CABLE/GUARDRAIL 2017- 5	County: Various
		Project:		

Contract Description: On-call repair of guardrail, cable median barrier, impact attenuators and fence at various locations throughout District 6.

1163	Collins & Hermann, Inc.	
	1215 Dunn Road St. Louis, MO 63138 Phone: (314) 869-8000 Fax: (314) 869-8498 msedelkova@collinsandhermann.com	\$933,263.75
1112	Clevenger Contractors, Inc.	
	PO Box 19 Bluffs, IL 62621 355 Naples Road Bluffs, IL 62621 Phone: (217) 754-3411 Fax: (217) 754-3537 clever@irtc.net	\$1,452,509.35
2763	Illini Excavation & Reclamation, Inc.	
	PO Box 87159 South Roxana, IL 62087 800 North Delmar Hartford, IL 62048 Phone: (618) 254-5588 Fax: (618) 254-8860 chris@illiniexcavation.com	(No Bid)
4055	Midwest Fence Corporation	
	900 N Kedzie Ave Chicago, IL 60651 Phone: (773) 722-6616 Fax: (773) 722-6626	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	020	Contract:	72L08	District: 6
Route:	FAS 1768	Section:	(117) OFF STREET PARKING	County: Montgomery
		Project:		

Contract Description: Pollinator habitat preservation and restoration, installation of a parking lot and path on northbound I-55 Frontage Road, 0.4 miles south of N 16th Avenue.

3108	Keller Construction, Inc.	
	22 Illini Drive Glen Carbon, IL 62034 Phone: (618) 656-0033 Fax: (618) 656-7134 Iori.nazetta@kellerconstruction.com	\$172,172.00
5802	Stutz Excavating, Inc.	
	3837 Fosterburg Road Alton, IL 62002 Phone: (618) 259-2485	\$176,346.50
3163	Kinney Contractors, Inc.	
	19342 E. Frontage Rd. Raymond, IL 62560 Phone: (217) 229-3322 Fax: (217) 229-3609 kinney@roadbuilder.net	\$205,807.00

Letting Item: 021 Route: FAP 75; FAP 714 Contract: 72L34 Section: (134, 135) PP Project: **District:** 6 **County:** Christian

Contract Description: Patching at two locations on (IL 29, IL48: 1) from Webster Street to Pershing Avenue in Taylorville; 2 just north of Lincoln Trail to 2.1 miles south of Spresser Street in Taylorville.

3163	Kinney Contractors, Inc.	
	19342 E. Frontage Rd.	\$162,895.00
	Raymond, IL 62560 Phone: (217) 229-3322	
	Fax: (217) 229-3609	
	kinney@roadbuilder.net	
5564	G. M. Sipes Construction, Inc.	
	P.O. BOX 109	\$221,450.00
	RUSHVILLE, IL 62681	· ,
	503 E. ADAMS ST	
	RUSHVILLE, IL 62681	
	Phone: (217) 322-6543	
	Fax: (217) 322-4712	
	support@gmsipes.com	

Letting Item: 022 Route: FAP 662 Contract: 72L35 Section: (2, 3) PP Project: District: 6 County: Sangamon

Contract Description: Patching on IL 4 from 0.2 miles north of Greenbriar Drive to south of Prairie Crossing Drive in Springfield.

2825	Illinois Valley Paving, a div of UCM, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 13420 Springfield, IL 62791 3151 Robbins Road Springfield, IL 62704 Phone: (217) 546-6192 Fax: (217) 546-1904 IVP@ucm.biz	\$805,119.35
1810	Truman L. Flatt & Sons Co., Inc.	
	2300 North 16th Street Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 544-3471 Fax: (217) 544-0861 rem@trumanlflatt.com	\$1,140,798.51
0635	P. H. Broughton & Sons, Inc.	
	905 N. Lincoln Ave. Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 787-2393 Fax: (217) 787-2397 kent@phbroughton.com	(No Bid)
5564	G. M. Sipes Construction, Inc.	
	P.O. BOX 109 RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 503 E. ADAMS ST RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 Phone: (217) 322-6543 Fax: (217) 322-4712 support@gmsipes.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 023 Route: VARIOUS Contract: 74894 Section: D7GUARDRAIL END SECTIONS2019-1 Project: HSIP8DCG(107) District: 7 County: Richland; Lawrence

Contract Description: Replacing obsolete guardrail and terminals at various locations in Richland and Lawrence Counties.

4055	Midwest Fence Corporation	
	900 N Kedzie Ave Chicago, IL 60651 Phone: (773) 722-6616 Fax: (773) 722-6626	\$970,709.00
1112	Clevenger Contractors, Inc.	
	PO Box 19 Bluffs, IL 62621 355 Naples Road Bluffs, IL 62621 Phone: (217) 754-3411 Fax: (217) 754-3537 clever@irtc.net	\$1,017,192.70
1163	Collins & Hermann, Inc.	
	1215 Dunn Road St. Louis, MO 63138 Phone: (314) 869-8000 Fax: (314) 869-8498 msedelkova@collinsandhermann.com	\$1,072,888.86
2763	Illini Excavation & Reclamation, Inc.	
	PO Box 87159 South Roxana, IL 62087 800 North Delmar Hartford, IL 62048 Phone: (618) 254-5588 Fax: (618) 254-8860 chris@illiniexcavation.com	(No Bid)
3524	Lovewell Fencing, Inc.	
	21060 Holden Drive Davenport, IA 52806 Phone: (563) 391-7025 Fax: (563) 391-4005 jschulz@lovewellfence.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	: 024	Contract:	74918	District: 7
Route:	FAI 70; FAP 320	Section:	D7 BRIDGE REPAIRS 2020-3	County: Various
		Project:		

Contract Description: Bridge parapet repairs on 3 structures in Clark, Fayette and Macon Counties (SN 012-0007, 026-0019, 058-0111).

2323	Halverson Construction Co., Inc.	
	620 N. 19th St. Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 753-0027 Fax: (217) 753-1904 hbid@halversonconstruction.com	\$145,001.06
3085	Keeley & Sons, Inc.	
	6303 Collinsville Road East St. Louis, IL 62201 Phone: (618) 271-7470 Fax: (618) 271-0830 Brian.Lurk@keeleyandsons.com	\$176,914.09
5310	Sangamo Construction Company	
	2100 East Moffat St Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 544-9871 Fax: (217) 544-9873 office@sangamo.net	\$182,888.29

Letting Item: 025	Deleted	Contract: 76J16	District: 8
Route:		Section:	County: St. Clair
		Project:	

Contract Description: 8.9 miles of resurfcing and ADA upgrades on IL 13/IL 15 from Roger's Drive in Freeburg to south of the Kaskasia River Bridge on IL 15.

No Electronic Bids

No Authorized Bidders

Letting Item:	026	Contract:	76J86	District:	8
Route:	FAP 600; FAP 592	Section:	34-1,127-1SW-1,65-1SW-1	County:	Madison
		Project:	NHPP-STPNSDE(740)		

Contract Description: Constructing ADA accessible sidewalk ramps on IL 159 from Park Street in Edwardsville to Glen Crossing Road in Glen Carbon and IL 157 from Vandalia Street/St. Louis Street in Edwardsville to Meridian Road in Glen Carbon.

3108	Keller Construction, Inc.	
	22 Illini Drive Glen Carbon, IL 62034 Phone: (618) 656-0033 Fax: (618) 656-7134 Iori.nazetta@kellerconstruction.com	\$349,450.15
2308	Hank's Excavating & Landscaping, Inc. 5825 West State Route 161 Belleville, IL 62223 Phone: (618) 398-5556 Fax: (618) 398-2729	(No Bid)
4732	Petroff Trucking Company, Inc. P.O. Box 148 Collinsville, IL 62234 3469 State Rt. 111 Pontoon Beach, IL 62040 Phone: (618) 797-6100 Fax: (618) 797-6105 Adam@PetroffTrucking.com	(No Bid)
4928	RCS Construction, Inc. 960 E. Airline Drive East Alton, IL 62024 Phone: (618) 254-3816 Fax: (618) 254-3841 julie@rcs-construction.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	027	Contract:	76L56	District: 8
Route:	FAP 304	Section:	119-I-4	County: Jersey
		Project:	FBPA6KR(021)	

Contract Description: Serpentine and parking lot resurfacing, ADA upgrades, lighting, and roadway ramp reconstruction. Project includes dredging at the Brussels Ferry.

4928	RCS Construction, Inc.	
	960 E. Airline Drive East Alton, IL 62024 Phone: (618) 254-3816 Fax: (618) 254-3841 julie@rcs-construction.com	\$2,267,111.15
3085	Keeley & Sons, Inc.	
	6303 Collinsville Road East St. Louis, IL 62201 Phone: (618) 271-7470 Fax: (618) 271-0830 Brian.Lurk@keeleyandsons.com	\$2,285,740.56
3108	Keller Construction, Inc.	
	22 Illini Drive Glen Carbon, IL 62034 Phone: (618) 656-0033 Fax: (618) 656-7134 Iori.nazetta@kellerconstruction.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	: 029	Contract:	78734	District: 9
Route:	FAP 331	Section:	D9 TREE PLANTING 2020-1	County: Saline
		Project:		

Contract Description: Tree planting for wetland mitigation site and proposed steel plate weir along IL 13 near Lovers Lane, west of Harrisburg.

4373	Nettle Creek Nursery, Inc.		
	1201 Fremont Ave Morris, IL 60450 320 Ottawa Street Morris, IL 60450 Phone: (815) 693-9763 nettlecreeknursery@gmail.com		\$64,465.00
1675	Endrizzi Contracting, Inc		
	610 Old Route 146 Vienna, IL 62995 Phone: (618) 771-2888 amanda@endrizzicontracting.com		\$71,217.40

Letting Item: 030		Contract:	91581	District: 5
Route:	KICKAPOO; TRAIL	Section:	08-F3000-03-BT	County: Vermilion
		Project:	04ZS(788)	

Contract Description: Construction of a pedestrian trail on abandoned CSX Railroad alignment, from Grays Siding Road to the Vermilion County Fairgrounds.

2323	Halverson Construction Co., Inc.	
	620 N. 19th St. Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 753-0027 Fax: (217) 753-1904 hbid@halversonconstruction.com	\$3,038,480.04
1250	Cross Construction, Inc.	
	3615 N Countryview Rd Urbana, IL 61802 Phone: (217) 367-3526 Fax: (217) 337-3066 closchen@crossconstructioncorp.com	(No Bid)
5672	Stark Excavating, Inc.	
	1805 W Washington St. Bloomington, IL 61701 Phone: (309) 828-5034 Fax: (309) 829-3897 estimating@starkcompanies.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 031 Route: FAU 8011 Contract: 93719 Section: 17-00431-02-PV (SPRINGFIELD) Project: 66WG(930) District: 6 County: Sangamon

Contract Description: Reconstruction of Archer Elevator Road from 2-lane rural to 3-lane urban roadway in Springfield.

2825	Illinois Valley Paving, a div of UCM, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 13420 Springfield, IL 62791 3151 Robbins Road Springfield, IL 62704 Phone: (217) 546-6192 Fax: (217) 546-1904 IVP@ucm.biz	\$4,283,745.98
0635	P. H. Broughton & Sons, Inc.	
	905 N. Lincoln Ave. Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 787-2393 Fax: (217) 787-2397 kent@phbroughton.com	\$4,465,855.94
1810	Truman L. Flatt & Sons Co., Inc.	
	2300 North 16th Street Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 544-3471 Fax: (217) 544-0861 rem@trumanlflatt.com	\$4,578,860.85
5310	Sangamo Construction Company	
	2100 East Moffat St Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 544-9871 Fax: (217) 544-9873 office@sangamo.net	\$5,071,103.87

Letting Item:	: 032	Contract:	95849	District: 7
Route:	LINCOLN; PRAIRIE; TRAIL	Section:	16-00112-00-BT (CHARLESTON)	County: Coles
		Project:	G3E4(469)	

Contract Description: Improvements to the bike trail connecting Charleston and Matoon, includes extending the west end from 10th street to the Amtrak Depot and connect the east end to Eastern Illinois University.

2692	Howell Paving, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 1009 Mattoon, IL 61938 1020 N. 13th Street Mattoon, IL 61938 Phone: (217) 234-8877 Fax: (217) 234-4226 estimates@howellco.com	\$1,843,105.78
4362	Ne-Co Asphalt Co., Inc.	
	PO Box 25 Charleston, IL 61920 812 Adkins Drive Charleston, IL 61920 Phone: (217) 345-2002 Fax: (217) 345-2037 neco66@consolidated.net	\$1,871,963.50

Letting Item: 033 Route: FAS 1814 Contract: 95857 Section: 14-00068-00-RS Project: KJU1(847) District: 7 County: Edwards

Contract Description: Resurfacing Browns Grayville Road from East 450 North Road to IL 1.

2692	Howell Paving, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 1009	\$1,153,827.78
	Mattoon, IL 61938	\$1,100,021110
	1020 N. 13th Street	
	Mattoon, IL 61938	
	Phone: (217) 234-8877	
	Fax: (217) 234-4226	
	estimates@howellco.com	

Letting Item:	034	Contract:	95858	District:	7
Route:	TR 271A	Section:	17-02120-00-BR	County:	Shelby
		Project:	LLFU(387)		

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying TR 271A over Drake Creek, 4.5 miles east of Strasburg.

1439	Depew and Owen Builders, Inc.	
	PO Box 1252 Centralia, IL 62801 301 N. Oak Street Centralia, IL 62801 Phone: (618) 532-1160 ronnie@depewandowen.com	\$546,988.00
1232	County Contractors, Inc. P.O. Box 3522 Quincy, IL 62305 1228 East 1350th Street Quincy, IL 62305 Phone: (217) 885-3550 Fax: (217) 885-3575 chris@countycontractorsinc.com	\$595,291.33
4757	Plocher Construction Company, Inc. 2808 Thole-Plocher Road Highland, IL 62249 Phone: (618) 654-9408 Fax: (618) 654-6454 bids@plocherco.com	(No Bid)
5306	Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc. PO Box 1555 Murphysboro, IL 62966 Phone: (618) 687-5500 Fax: (618) 684-9341 info@samron.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	035	Contract:	99617	District: 9
Route:	TR 412A	Section:	09-05116-00-BR	County: White
		Project:	YDVW(637)	

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying TR 412A over French Creek, 1 mile north of Calvin.

5306	Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.	
	PO Box 1555 Murphysboro, IL 62966 Phone: (618) 687-5500 Fax: (618) 684-9341 info@samron.com	\$348,240.50
5550	E. T. Simonds Construction Company	
	PO Box 2107 Carbondale, IL 62902 1500 N Oakland Ave PO Box 2107 Carbondale, IL 62902 Phone: (618) 457-8191 Fax: (618) 549-0131 mrodewald@etsimonds.com	\$373,935.95
1389	Dees, Inc.	
	2045 Winery Road West Frankfort, IL 62896 Phone: (618) 525-2504 Fax: (618) 932-3884 deesinc@frontier.com	\$385,460.00
0104	Allendale Gravel Co., Inc.	
	18306 Wabash 18 Avenue Allendale, IL 62410 Phone: (618) 263-3521 Fax: (618) 263-3747 agco@allendalegravel.com	(No Bid)
3352	Lake Contracting, Inc.	
	4650 Stone Church Rd. Addieville, IL 62214 Phone: (618) 824-6522 Fax: (618) 824-6521 darylf70@yahoo.com	(No Bid)

(No Bid)

Illinois Department of Transportation As Accepted Tabulation of Bids For Letting: 08/02/2019

Letting Item: 035 Route: TR 412A Contract: 99617 Section: 09-05116-00-BR Project: YDVW(637) District: 9 County: White

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying TR 412A over French Creek, 1 mile north of Calvin.

5526 Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC

PO Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 7038 Highway 154 P.O. Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 Phone: (618) 924-1077 Fax: (618) 625-6516 bdorrissbcllc@hotmail.com

Letting Item: 036 Route: FAS 822 Contract: 99623 Section: 97-00162-00-RS Project: S2JK(035) District: 9 County: Jefferson

Contract Description: Resurfacing Tolle Lane from Fairfield Road to Miller Lake Lane in Mt. Vernon.

5609 Southern Illinois Asphalt Co., Inc.

1003 Aspen St. Marion, IL 62959 Phone: (618) 998-1615 Fax: (618) 998-1744 jmcphail@deltacos.com

\$958,186.83

\$877,734.31

Illinois Department of Transportation As Accepted Tabulation of Bids For Letting: 08/02/2019

Letting Item: 037		Contract:	61F18	District: 1			
Route:	BRIDGE ST	Section:	15-00024-00-BT	County: Will			
		Project:	(CHANNAHON) 6WMJ(986)				
constru	Contract Description: Construction of a multi-use path from McKinley Woods road to landM Canal and the construction of a pedestrian bridge over the landM Canal. Project is located along US Route 6 and Bridge Street, beginning west of McKinley Drive and ending east of the landM Canal at Bridge Street in the Village of Channahon.						
1320 D. Construction, Inc.							
	1488 So. Broadway			\$734,855.97			
	Coal City, IL 60416						
	Phone: (815) 634-2555						
	Fax: (815) 634-8748						

2520 HERLIHY MID-CONTINENT COMPANY 1306 MARQUETTE DRIVE ROMEOVILLE, IL 60446 Phone: (630) 378-1000 Fax: (630) 378-1002

bids@dconstruction.com

Phone: (708) 326-3406 Fax: (708) 326-3499 arenteria@jbcco.com

	becky@hmcco.net	
2779	ICC Group Inc.	
	39W866 Fabyan Parkway Elburn, IL 60119 Phone: (630) 232-7280 Fax: (630) 232-7281	\$969,900.00
1750	P. T. Ferro Construction Co.	
	P.O. Box 156 Joliet, IL 60434 700 South Rowell Ave. Joliet, IL 60433 Phone: (815) 726-6284 Fax: (815) 726-5614 estimating@ptferro.com	\$984,243.76
0103	Alliance Contractors, Inc.	
	1166 Lake Avenue Woodstock, IL 60098 Phone: (815) 338-5900 Fax: (815) 338-9109 estimating@alliancecontractors.com	(No Bid)
0733	John Burns Construction Company	
	17601 Southwest Highway Orland Park, IL 60467	(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

\$680,492.76

Illinois Department of Transportation As Accepted Tabulation of Bids For Letting: 08/02/2019

Letting Item: 038 Route: FAS 256 Contract: 87703 Section: 16-00367-00-SP Project: XLVT(884) District: 3 County: LaSalle

Contract Description: Reconstruct the intersection of CH43 and CH33, located 4.0 miles north of Utica.

0049 Advanced Asphalt Company

PO Box 234 Princeton, IL 61356 308 W Railroad Ave Princeton, IL 61356 Phone: (815) 872-9911 Fax: (815) 872-0569 bbruins@advasphalt.biz

Letting Item:	039	Contract:	93731	District:	6
Route:	TR 175	Section:	14-04115-00-BR	County:	Hancock
		Project:	PC58(943)		

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying TR 175 over the La Moine River, located 4.5 miles northeast of Carthage.

1232	County Contractors, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 3522 Quincy, IL 62305 1228 East 1350th Street Quincy, IL 62305 Phone: (217) 885-3550 Fax: (217) 885-3575 chris@countycontractorsinc.com	\$999,695.50
3391	Laverdiere Construction, Inc.	
	4055 W Jackson St Macomb, IL 61455 Phone: (309) 837-1258 Fax: (309) 833-4993 mlynn@lavconinc.com	\$1,348,700.20
1908	Freesen, a div of UCM, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 13420 Springfield, IL 62791 3151 Robbins Road Springfield, IL 62704 Phone: (217) 546-6192 Fax: (217) 546-1904 Fl@ucm.biz	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 040 Route: FAP 666
 Contract:
 93733

 Section:
 (109)VB, (110)VB-5 SPRINGFIELD

 Project:
 MFYW(203)
 District: 6 County: Sangamon

Contract Description: Replace the structures carrying NS Railroad over 5th and 6th streets, and, the construction of new structures to carry the UP railroad over 5th and 6th Street in Springfield.

1908	Freesen, a div of UCM, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 13420 Springfield, IL 62791 3151 Robbins Road Springfield, IL 62704 Phone: (217) 546-6192 Fax: (217) 546-1904 Fl@ucm.biz	\$32,059,959.11
2779	ICC Group Inc.	
	39W866 Fabyan Parkway Elburn, IL 60119 Phone: (630) 232-7280 Fax: (630) 232-7281	\$33,716,000.00
4757	Plocher Construction Company, Inc.	
	2808 Thole-Plocher Road Highland, IL 62249 Phone: (618) 654-9408 Fax: (618) 654-6454 bids@plocherco.com	\$34,146,600.00
5310	Sangamo Construction Company	
	2100 East Moffat St Springfield, IL 62702 Phone: (217) 544-9871 Fax: (217) 544-9873 office@sangamo.net	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	041	Contract:	95854	District:	7
Route:	FAS 708	Section:	17-00097-00-BR	County:	Effingham
		Project:	32KM(542)		

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying FAX 708 over Muddy Creek, 1 mile west of Winterrowd

1439	Depew and Owen Builders, Inc.	
	PO Box 1252 Centralia, IL 62801 301 N. Oak Street Centralia, IL 62801 Phone: (618) 532-1160 ronnie@depewandowen.com	\$368,488.00
5306	Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.	
	PO Box 1555 Murphysboro, IL 62966 Phone: (618) 687-5500 Fax: (618) 684-9341 info@samron.com	\$398,409.00
4757	Plocher Construction Company, Inc.	
	2808 Thole-Plocher Road Highland, IL 62249 Phone: (618) 654-9408 Fax: (618) 654-6454 bids@plocherco.com	\$444,540.00
0104	Allendale Gravel Co., Inc.	
	18306 Wabash 18 Avenue Allendale, IL 62410 Phone: (618) 263-3521 Fax: (618) 263-3747 agco@allendalegravel.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 042 Route: TR 285 Contract: 95855 Section: 18-05126-00-BR Project: EC51(795) District: 7 County: Lawrence

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying TR 285 over Big Slough Drainage Ditch, 1 mile southwest of St. Francisville.

0104	Allendale Gravel Co., Inc.	
	18306 Wabash 18 Avenue Allendale, IL 62410 Phone: (618) 263-3521 Fax: (618) 263-3747 agco@allendalegravel.com	\$368,062.00
5306	Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.	
	PO Box 1555 Murphysboro, IL 62966 Phone: (618) 687-5500 Fax: (618) 684-9341 info@samron.com	\$378,525.75

Letting Item: 043		Contract:	95859	District:	7
Route:	TR 34A	Section:	15-15111-00-BR	County:	Effingham
		Project:	AHRF(702)		

Contract Description: Replace the bridge carrying Tr 34A over Limestone Creek, 3.5 miles west of Edgewood.

5306	Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.	
	PO Box 1555 Murphysboro, IL 62966 Phone: (618) 687-5500 Fax: (618) 684-9341 info@samron.com	\$177,699.00
1439	Depew and Owen Builders, Inc.	
	PO Box 1252 Centralia, IL 62801 301 N. Oak Street Centralia, IL 62801 Phone: (618) 532-1160 ronnie@depewandowen.com	\$181,438.00
4757	Plocher Construction Company, Inc.	
	2808 Thole-Plocher Road Highland, IL 62249 Phone: (618) 654-9408 Fax: (618) 654-6454 bids@plocherco.com	\$218,239.00
0104	Allendale Gravel Co., Inc.	
	18306 Wabash 18 Avenue Allendale, IL 62410 Phone: (618) 263-3521 Fax: (618) 263-3747 agco@allendalegravel.com	(No Bid)
3352	Lake Contracting, Inc.	
	4650 Stone Church Rd. Addieville, IL 62214 Phone: (618) 824-6522 Fax: (618) 824-6521 darylf70@yahoo.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 044		Contract:	97689	District: 8
Route:	FAU 9212	Section:	12-00007-01-WR (SAUGET)	County: St. Clair
		Project:	LFTI(404)	

Contract Description: Reconstruct the intersection of Curtiss-Steinberg Drive at Sauget Business Boulevard in the village of Sauget.

3108	Keller Construction, Inc.	
	22 Illini Drive Glen Carbon, IL 62034 Phone: (618) 656-0033 Fax: (618) 656-7134 Iori.nazetta@kellerconstruction.com	\$678,178.64
0338	Baxmeyer Construction, Inc.	
	1034 Floraville Road Waterloo, IL 62298 Phone: (618) 939-3000 Fax: (618) 939-4299	\$738,877.00
2308	Hank's Excavating & Landscaping, Inc.	
	5825 West State Route 161 Belleville, IL 62223 Phone: (618) 398-5556 Fax: (618) 398-2729	\$832,197.33
1034	Christ Bros. Asphalt, Inc.	
	820 s fritz st. P.O. Box 158 Lebanon, IL 62254 Phone: (618) 537-6174 Fax: (618) 537-6199	(No Bid)
3157	The Kilian Corporation	
	P.O. Box A Mascoutah, IL 62258 608 South Independence Street Mascoutah, IL 62258 Phone: (618) 566-2000 Fax: (618) 566-2314 sharon.weier@kiliancorp.com	(No Bid)
4928	RCS Construction, Inc.	
	960 E. Airline Drive East Alton, IL 62024 Phone: (618) 254-3816 Fax: (618) 254-3841 julie@rcs-construction.com	(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

Letting Item:	045	Contract:	97704	District: 8
Route:	FAU 8971	Section:	18-00047-03-LS (WOOD RIVER)	County: Madison
		Project:	VMYM(386)	

Contract Description: Sidewalk replacement, decorative posts and patterned pavement imprinting along Ferguson Avenue betwen Old St. Louis Road and 2nd Street in Wood River.

4928	RCS Construction, Inc.	
	960 E. Airline Drive East Alton, IL 62024 Phone: (618) 254-3816 Fax: (618) 254-3841 julie@rcs-construction.com	\$456,469.05
3108	Keller Construction, Inc.	
	22 Illini Drive Glen Carbon, IL 62034 Phone: (618) 656-0033 Fax: (618) 656-7134 Iori.nazetta@kellerconstruction.com	\$633,000.00
2308	Hank's Excavating & Landscaping, Inc.	
	5825 West State Route 161 Belleville, IL 62223 Phone: (618) 398-5556 Fax: (618) 398-2729	(No Bid)
4757	Plocher Construction Company, Inc.	
	2808 Thole-Plocher Road Highland, IL 62249 Phone: (618) 654-9408 Fax: (618) 654-6454 bids@plocherco.com	(No Bid)
5802	Stutz Excavating, Inc.	
	3837 Fosterburg Road Alton, IL 62002 Phone: (618) 259-2485	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	046	Contract:	99628	District: 9
Route:	FAS 881	Section:	15-00125-00-BR	County: White
		Project:	8C5U(883)	

Contract Description: replace the bridge carrying CH 18 over Bear Creek Tributary with a 19' X 7' box culvert, located 2 miles southwest of Norris City.

5526	Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC	
	PO Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 7038 Highway 154 P.O. Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 Phone: (618) 924-1077 Fax: (618) 625-6516 bdorrissbcllc@hotmail.com	\$184,217.86
1389	Dees, Inc.	
	2045 Winery Road West Frankfort, IL 62896 Phone: (618) 525-2504 Fax: (618) 932-3884 deesinc@frontier.com	\$187,874.00
5306	Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.	
	PO Box 1555 Murphysboro, IL 62966 Phone: (618) 687-5500 Fax: (618) 684-9341 info@samron.com	\$198,270.50
5550	E. T. Simonds Construction Company	
	PO Box 2107 Carbondale, IL 62902 1500 N Oakland Ave PO Box 2107 Carbondale, IL 62902 Phone: (618) 457-8191 Fax: (618) 549-0131 mrodewald@etsimonds.com	\$243,980.08
0104	Allendale Gravel Co., Inc.	
	18306 Wabash 18 Avenue Allendale, IL 62410 Phone: (618) 263-3521 Fax: (618) 263-3747 agco@allendalegravel.com	(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

Letting Item: 046 Route: FAS 881 Contract: 99628 Section: 15-00125-00-BR Project: 8C5U(883) District: 9 County: White

Contract Description: replace the bridge carrying CH 18 over Bear Creek Tributary with a 19' X 7' box culvert, located 2 miles southwest of Norris City.

3352	Lake Contracting, Inc.	
	4650 Stone Church Rd.	(No Bid)
	Addieville, IL 62214	
	Phone: (618) 824-6522	
	Fax: (618) 824-6521	
	darylf70@yahoo.com	

Letting Item:	047	Contract:	68E96	District: 4
Route:	FAP 646	Section:	(Y;126)PP	County: Peoria
		Project:		

Contract Description: 1.7 miles of patching and joint repair on IL 40 (Knoxville Avenue) from Timber Lane to Bethany Way in Peoria.

1284	R. A. Cullinan and Son, a div of UCM, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 166 Tremont, IL 61568 121 West Park Street Tremont, IL 61568 Phone: (309) 925-2711 Fax: (309) 925-7131 RACullinan@UCM.biz	\$276,561.73
5564	G. M. Sipes Construction, Inc.	
	P.O. BOX 109 RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 503 E. ADAMS ST RUSHVILLE, IL 62681 Phone: (217) 322-6543 Fax: (217) 322-4712 support@gmsipes.com	(No Bid)
5672	Stark Excavating, Inc.	
	1805 W Washington St. Bloomington, IL 61701 Phone: (309) 828-5034 Fax: (309) 829-3897 estimating@starkcompanies.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item:	048	Contract:	68E91	District: 4
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	D4 ITS SYSTEM 2019	County: Peoria
		Project:		

Contract Description: Installation of central traffic siganl system software, controllers and cabinets at various intersections in Peoria.

4446	Oberlander Electric Co.	
	2101 North Main St. East Peoria, IL 61611 2101 N. Main St. E.Peoria, IL 61611 Phone: (309) 694-1468 Fax: (309) 699-9108 rmarvin@oberlanderelectric.com	\$540,150.00
2037	Gerstner Electric, Inc.	
	2400 Cassens Drive Fenton, MO 63026 Phone: (636) 349-5999 Fax: (636) 680-5065 Bidding@gerstnerelectric.com	\$589,798.00
3382	Laser Electric, Inc.	
	PO Box 5008 Peoria, IL 61601 3611 S.W. Adams St. Peoria, IL 61605 Phone: (309) 693-2400 Fax: (309) 676-7732 jason.laser@comcast.net	\$615,657.35

Letting Item: 049		Contract:	62H78	District: 1
Route:	VARIOUS	Section:	2018-0148-I	County: Various
		Project:		

Contract Description: Concrete bridge deck sealing upon the entire top surface of the deck, top of sidewalks and inside and top of parapets at various locations throughout District 1.

3353	Lion Construction 1, LLC	
	2598 S. 14000 E. Road Pembroke Twp, IL 60958 Phone: (815) 944-5788 Fax: (815) 944-5787 Iajobiemosley@att.net	\$193,434.00
0103	Alliance Contractors, Inc.	
	1166 Lake Avenue Woodstock, IL 60098 Phone: (815) 338-5900 Fax: (815) 338-9109 estimating@alliancecontractors.com	\$602,317.44
3505	Lorig Construction Company	
	250 East Touhy Avenue Des Plaines, IL 60018 Phone: (847) 298-0360 Fax: (847) 298-2689 estimating@lorigconstruction.com	\$1,422,529.25
0115	All States Painting, Inc.	
	PO Box 110 Alexander, IL 62601 1458 State Highway 123 Alexander, IL 62601 Phone: (217) 478-2111 Fax: (217) 478-4881	(No Bid)
3596	M & M Concrete, Inc.	
	P.O. Box 40 Stockton, IL 61085 225 E. Carpenter Ave Stockton, IL 61085 Phone: (815) 947-2178 Fax: (815) 947-3191 mmconcreteoffice@gmail.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 049 Route: VARIOUS Contract: 62H78 Section: 2018-0148-I Project: District: 1 County: Various

Contract Description: Concrete bridge deck sealing upon the entire top surface of the deck, top of sidewalks and inside and top of parapets at various locations throughout District 1.

5832 Sumit Construction Co., Inc.

4150 W. Wrightwood Ave Chicago, IL 60639 Phone: (773) 276-4600 Fax: (773) 276-4644

(No Bid)

Letting Item: 050		Contract:	46526	District: 8
Route:	FAI 255; FAI 270	Section:	D8 PUMP STATIONS 2019	County: Madison
		Project:		

Contract Description: Pump station improvements at 2 locations: 1) I-255 at Grey's Farm/Sparks Lane in Collinsville; 2) I-270/Fun and Sun at West Chain of Rocks in Mitchell.

1671	Electrico, Inc.	
	7706 Wagner Road Millstadt, IL 62260 Phone: (618) 538-9500 Fax: (618) 538-7878 matt@electricoinc.us	\$60,484.79
4909	Pyramid Electrical Contractors, Inc.	
	300 Monticello Place Fairview Heights, IL 62208 Phone: (618) 632-1180 Fax: (618) 632-1128 scott@pyramidelectrical.com	\$61,380.00
6537	Wissehr Electric, Inc.	
	5801 W State Route 161 Belleville, IL 62223 Phone: (618) 398-7575 Fax: (618) 398-7180 jk@wissehr.com	\$68,863.00

Letting Item:	051	Contract:	46528	District: 6
Route:	FAP 320	Section:	D6 PUMP STATION 2019	County: Logan
		Project:		

Contract Description: Installation of new automatic transfer switch at the storm water pump station on IL 121.

No Electronic Bids

No Authorized Bidders

Letting Item: 01A Route: Contract: DE083 Section: DECATUR Project: 317SBGPTBD District: 7 County: Macon

Contract Description: Phase 2: Rehabilitate Asphalt Pavement on Runway 6-24; Rehabilitate Concrete Pavements on Runway 6-24 and 12-30

2825 Illinois Valley Paving, a div of UCM, Inc.

P.O. Box 13420 Springfield, IL 62791 3151 Robbins Road Springfield, IL 62704 Phone: (217) 546-6192 Fax: (217) 546-1904 IVP@ucm.biz

\$2,256,545.02

Letting Item: 02A	Contract:	KA049	District: 3
Route:	Section:	GREATER KANKAKEE	County: Kankakee
	Project:	317SBGPTBD	

Contract Description: Phase 2 - Install Security/Wildlife 10' Fencing

1746	Fence Masters, Inc.	
	20400 S. Cottage Grove Ave. Chicago Heights, IL 60411	\$1,874,545.40
3524	Lovewell Fencing, Inc.	
	21060 Holden Drive Davenport, IA 52806 Phone: (563) 391-7025 Fax: (563) 391-4005 jschulz@lovewellfence.com	\$2,092,000.00
1163	Collins & Hermann, Inc.	
	1215 Dunn Road St. Louis, MO 63138 Phone: (314) 869-8000 Fax: (314) 869-8498 msedelkova@collinsandhermann.com	(No Bid)
2836	Industrial Fence, Inc.	
	1300 S. Kilbourn Ave. Chicago, IL 60623 Phone: (773) 521-9900	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 03A	Contract:	LE053	District:	1
Route:	Section:	LEWIS UNIVERSITY	County:	Will
	Project:	317SBGPTBD		

Contract Description: Phase 3 - Reconstruct Remaining Taxiway B Including East of Taxiway E and West of Runway 2-20

1950	Gallagher Asphalt Corporation		
	18100 South Indiana Avenue Thornton, IL 60476 Phone: (708) 877-7160 Fax: (708) 877-5222 jkolmodin@gallagherasphalt.com	[\$2,545,831.05
6117	Austin Tyler Construction, Inc.		
	23343 S Ridge Road Elwood, IL 60421 Phone: (815) 726-1090 Fax: (815) 726-1171 info@austin-tyler.com		\$2,653,863.75
1320	D. Construction, Inc.		
	1488 So. Broadway Coal City, IL 60416 Phone: (815) 634-2555 Fax: (815) 634-8748 bids@dconstruction.com		\$2,997,455.10
1750	P. T. Ferro Construction Co.		
	P.O. Box 156 Joliet, IL 60434 700 South Rowell Ave. Joliet, IL 60433 Phone: (815) 726-6284 Fax: (815) 726-5614 estimating@ptferro.com		\$3,113,259.68
3069	K-Five Construction Corporation		
	999 Oakmont Plaza Drive Suite 200 Westmont, IL 60559 Phone: (630) 257-5600 Fax: (630) 257-6788 estimating@k-five.net		\$3,134,144.57

Letting Item: 03A Route: Contract: LE053 Section: LEWIS UNIVERSITY Project: 317SBGPTBD District: 1 County: Will

Contract Description: Phase 3 - Reconstruct Remaining Taxiway B Including East of Taxiway E and West of Runway 2-20

1560 R. W. DUNTEMAN COMPANY

P. O. BOX 1129 ADDISON, IL 60101 600 S. LOMBARD RD. ADDISON, IL 60101 Phone: (630) 953-1500 Fax: (630) 932-0994 estimating@rwdco.com

\$2,761,678.11

Illinois Department of Transportation As Accepted Tabulation of Bids For Letting: 08/02/2019

Letting Item: 04A Route: Contract:CO067DistrictSection:COLES COUNTY MEMORIALCountyProject:317SBGPTBD

District: 7 County: Coles

Contract Description: Phase 2: Reconstruct Taxiway B

2692 Howell Paving, Inc.

P.O. Box 1009 Mattoon, IL 61938 1020 N. 13th Street Mattoon, IL 61938 Phone: (217) 234-8877 Fax: (217) 234-4226 estimates@howellco.com

Letting Item: 05A	Withdrawn Contrac	t: UN058	District: 5
Route:	Section	: U OF I - WILLARD	County: Champaign
	Project	3170016033	
	Project	3170016033	

Contract Description: Reconstruct Taxiway A5/A6 (RSAT Requirement)

No Electronic Bids

No Authorized Bidders

Letting Item: 06A Route:

Contract: UN059 Section: U OF I - WILLARD Project: 3170016TBD **District:** 5 **County:** Champaign

Contract Description: Install Taxiway Lighting and Signage

0936	Champaign Signal and Lighting Co. A Division of Champaign Asphalt Company LLC				
	PO Box 1730 Champaign, IL 61824	Base	\$752,235.00		
1414 W. Anthony Drive	Add 1	\$159,426.30			
	Urbana, IL 61802				

Phone: (217) 356-2518 Fax: (217) 356-1539 kyleb@champaignasphalt.com

Letting Item: 07A	Contract:	DU086	District:	1
Route:	Section:	DUPAGE	County:	DuPage
	Project:	317SBGPTBD		

Contract Description: Phase III - Upgrade Wildlife Hazard Fencing on Northern Airport Boundary

1746	Fence Masters, Inc.		
	20400 S. Cottage Grove Ave. Chicago Heights, IL 60411	Base	\$970,556.47
		Add 1	\$32,991.00
1856	Foundation Mechanics		
	2860 South River Road, Suite 120 Des Plaines, IL 60018	Base	\$1,049,823.00
	Phone: (773) 234-3087 Fax: (815) 301-3738	Add 1	\$23,565.00
2836	Industrial Fence, Inc.		
	1300 S. Kilbourn Ave. Chicago, IL 60623	Base	\$1,553,441.80
	Phone: (773) 521-9900	Add 1	\$47,931.21
3524	Lovewell Fencing, Inc.		
	21060 Holden Drive Davenport, IA 52806	Base	\$1,653,605.50
	Phone: (563) 391-7025 Fax: (563) 391-4005 jschulz@lovewellfence.com	Add 1	\$68,338.50

Letting Item: 08A	Contract:	WA074	District: 1
Route:	Section:	WAUKEGAN NATIONAL	County: Lake
	Project:	317SBGPTBD	

Contract Description: Rehabilitate Runway 5/23

0280	Peter Baker & Son Co.	
	P.O. Box 187 Lake Bluff, IL 60044 1349 Rockland Road Lake Bluff, IL 60044 Phone: (847) 362-3663 Fax: (847) 362-0707 john@peterbaker.com	\$2,093,895.00
1560	R. W. DUNTEMAN COMPANY	
	P. O. BOX 1129 ADDISON, IL 60101 600 S. LOMBARD RD. ADDISON, IL 60101 Phone: (630) 953-1500 Fax: (630) 932-0994 estimating@rwdco.com	\$2,232,302.50
4696	Payne & Dolan, Inc.	
	28435 West IL Route 173 Antioch, IL 60002 Phone: (847) 838-3700	(No Bid)
4813	Plote Construction, Inc.	
	1100 Brandt Drive Hoffman Estates, IL 60192 Phone: (847) 695-9300 Fax: (847) 695-9317 bids@plote.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 1LR	Contract:	M1901	District:	0
Route:	Section:		County:	Williamson
	Project:	AML-GWmE-1901		

Contract Description: Reclamation of the Forsythe Energy C.C. Cambria abandoned mine site by the Department of Natural Resources using federal Abandoned Mined Lands Funds

2055	Gibbs Construction	
	PO Box 11 Modesto, IL 62667 211 East Pine Street Modesto, IL 62667 Phone: (618) 218-0257 gibcontd25@gmail.com	\$1,808,431.20
4456	Oak Hill Contractors LLC	
	20245 Ewing Road Ewing, IL 62836 Phone: (618) 599-3690	\$2,013,624.12
5526	Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC	
	PO Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 7038 Highway 154 P.O. Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 Phone: (618) 924-1077 Fax: (618) 625-6516 bdorrissbcllc@hotmail.com	\$2,118,386.64
1244	K. D. Crain and Sons, Inc.	
	13751 Prosperity Road Johnston City, IL 62951-9801	\$2,571,816.35
5463	Shores Builders, Inc.	
	1154 Schwartz Road Centralia, IL 62801 Phone: (618) 532-3997 Fax: (618) 532-9719 jheltsley@shoresbuilders.com	\$2,571,983.81
0338	Baxmeyer Construction, Inc.	
	1034 Floraville Road Waterloo, IL 62298 Phone: (618) 939-3000 Fax: (618) 939-4299	(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to determine who is bidding on a project.

Letting Item: 1LR	Contract:	M1901	District:	0
Route:	Section:		County:	Williamson
	Project:	AML-GWmE-1901		

Contract Description: Reclamation of the Forsythe Energy C.C. Cambria abandoned mine site by the Department of Natural Resources using federal Abandoned Mined Lands Funds

3064	Kamadulski Excavating and Grading Company, Inc.	
	4336 Hwy. 162 Granite City, IL 62040 Phone: (618) 931-3760 Fax: (618) 797-1228 Iois@kamadulski.com	(No Bid)
3311	L. W. Contractors, Inc.	
	123 Green Park Dr. Collinsville, IL 62234 Phone: (618) 344-6353 Fax: (618) 344-2515 chris@lwcontractors.com	(No Bid)
4122	Miller and Son Construction Co.	
	PO Box 289 Mackinaw, IL 61755 307 W. First St. Mackinaw, IL 61755 Phone: (309) 359-8066 Fax: (309) 359-8653 dmjvmiller@yahoo.com	(No Bid)
4263	Mott Excavating, Inc.	
	PO Box 613 Vienna, IL 62995 1210 Lake Autumn Lane Vienna, IL 62995 Phone: (618) 658-2605 Fax: (618) 658-3214 mottexc@yahoo.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 2LR	Contract:	M1902	District:	0
Route:	Section:		County:	Williamson
	Project:	AML-GWmE-1902		

Contract Description: Reclamation of the Simco Carbon C.C. #1 Phase II abandoned mine site by the Department of Natural Resources using federal Abandoned Mined Lands Funds

5526	Sierra Bravo Contractors, LLC	
	PO Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 7038 Highway 154 P.O. Box 130 Sesser, IL 62884 Phone: (618) 924-1077 Fax: (618) 625-6516 bdorrissbcllc@hotmail.com	\$152,621.51
2055	Gibbs Construction	
	PO Box 11 Modesto, IL 62667 211 East Pine Street Modesto, IL 62667 Phone: (618) 218-0257 gibcontd25@gmail.com	\$189,443.29
1244	K. D. Crain and Sons, Inc.	
	13751 Prosperity Road Johnston City, IL 62951-9801	\$215,893.00
4456	Oak Hill Contractors LLC	
	20245 Ewing Road Ewing, IL 62836 Phone: (618) 599-3690	\$216,980.09
5463	Shores Builders, Inc.	
	1154 Schwartz Road Centralia, IL 62801 Phone: (618) 532-3997 Fax: (618) 532-9719 jheltsley@shoresbuilders.com	\$239,021.81
3064	Kamadulski Excavating and Grading Company, Inc.	
	4336 Hwy. 162 Granite City, IL 62040 Phone: (618) 931-3760 Fax: (618) 797-1228 Iois@kamadulski.com	(No Bid)

Letting Item: 2LR	Contract:	M1902	District:	0
Route:	Section:		County:	Williamson
	Project:	AML-GWmE-1902		

Contract Description: Reclamation of the Simco Carbon C.C. #1 Phase II abandoned mine site by the Department of Natural Resources using federal Abandoned Mined Lands Funds

4122	Miller and Son Construction Co.	
	PO Box 289 Mackinaw, IL 61755 307 W. First St. Mackinaw, IL 61755 Phone: (309) 359-8066 Fax: (309) 359-8653 dmjvmiller@yahoo.com	(No Bid)
4263	Mott Excavating, Inc.	
	PO Box 613 Vienna, IL 62995 1210 Lake Autumn Lane Vienna, IL 62995 Phone: (618) 658-2605 Fax: (618) 658-3214 mottexc@yahoo.com	(No Bid)
4373	Nettle Creek Nursery, Inc.	
	1201 Fremont Ave Morris, IL 60450 320 Ottawa Street Morris, IL 60450 Phone: (815) 693-9763 nettlecreeknursery@gmail.com	(No Bid)