lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

At this time and prior to a post-letting review, the following projects are within a reasonable approximation of the
Estimate.

1 YES
2 YES
3 YES
4 YES
5 YES
6 YES
7 NO
8 YES
9 YES
10 YES
11 YES
12 NO
13 YES
14 YES
15 YES
16 YES
17 YES
18 YES
19 YES
20 YES
21 NO
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 001 Contract: 62T04 District: 1
Route: FAP 330 Section: FAP 0330 22 BJ2 County: Will
Project: NHPPXJUP(220) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: The proposed improvement consists of bridge deck overlay, reconstruction of abutment deck
joint, approach slab repairs and substructure repairs of the bridge located on La Grange Road/US 45 at Hickory
Creek in Will County. Gross length: 4854 Ft (0.919 Mi), Net length: 1327 Ft (0.252 Mi).

1320 D. Construction, Inc.

1488 So. Broadway $1,407,207.03
Coal City, IL 60416
Phone: (815) 634-2555
Fax: (815) 634-8748
bids@dconstruction.com

0204 Areatha Construction Co., Inc.

410 E. North Avenue $1,789.808.43
Streamwood, IL 60107

Phone: (630) 830-9853

Fax: (630) 830-9856

areathaconstco@sbcglobal.net

4969 Rausch Infrastructure, LLC

1111 E Touhy Avenue, Suite 120 $1,940,172.71
Des Plaines, IL 60018

Phone: (708) 667-0165

Fax: (847) 813-9710

mijkovalsky@rausch.lic

3574 MYS, Incorporated

12416 S. Harlem Ave $1,956,62006
Palos Heights, IL 60463

Phone: (708) 448-0983

Fax: (708) 448-8098

tyelnick@mysincorporated.com

0103 Alliance Contractors, Inc.

1166 Lake Avenue (NO Bld)
Woodstock, IL 60098

Phone: (815) 338-5900

Fax: (815) 338-9109

estimating@alliancecontractors.com

1552 Dunnet Bay Construction Company

115 N. Brandon Drive (No Bid)
Glendale Heights, IL 60139

Phone: (630) 539-1200

Fax: (630) 539-4171

estimating@dunnetbay.net

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 001 Contract: 62T04 District: 1
Route: FAP 330 Section: FAP 0330 22 BJ2 County: Will
Project: NHPPXJUP(220) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: The proposed improvement consists of bridge deck overlay, reconstruction of abutment deck
joint, approach slab repairs and substructure repairs of the bridge located on La Grange Road/US 45 at Hickory
Creek in Will County. Gross length: 4854 Ft (0.919 Mi), Net length: 1327 Ft (0.252 Mi).

1750 P. T. Ferro Construction Co.

Joliet, IL 60434

700 South Rowell Ave.
Joliet, IL 60433

Phone: (815) 726-6284
Fax: (815) 726-5614
estimating@ptferro.com

3702 Martam Construction Incorporated

1200 Gasket Dr (NO Bld)
Elgin, IL 60120

Phone: (847) 608-6800

Fax: (847) 608-6804

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 002 Contract: 62T17 District: 1
Route: FAP 347 Section: FAP 0347 22 BJ3 County: DuPage
Project: NHPPE3Q6(948) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: (760-Ft) Bridge Deck Overlay, Bridge Joint Replacement / Repair at IL 38 (Roosevelt Rd) at IL
53. This project is located in the Village of Glen Ellyn in DuPage County.

1320 D. Construction, Inc.

1488 So. Broadway $1.972.825.91
Coal City, IL 60416
Phone: (815) 634-2555
Fax: (815) 634-8748
bids@dconstruction.com

3702 Martam Construction Incorporated

1200 Gasket Dr $2,087,593.29
Elgin, IL 60120

Phone: (847) 608-6800

Fax: (847) 608-6804

0204 Areatha Construction Co., Inc.

410 E. North Avenue $2,128,19884
Streamwood, IL 60107

Phone: (630) 830-9853

Fax: (630) 830-9856

areathaconstco@sbcglobal.net

1560 R.W.DUNTEMAN COMPANY

P.0.BOX 1129 $2,367,247.51
ADDISON, IL 60101

600 S. LOMBARD RD.
ADDISON, IL 60101
Phone: (630) 953-1500
Fax: (630) 932-0994
estimating@rwdco.com

0103 Alliance Contractors, Inc.

1166 Lake Avenue $2,481,975.67
Woodstock, IL 60098

Phone: (815) 338-5900

Fax: (815) 338-9109

estimating@alliancecontractors.com

3505  Lorig Construction Company

250 East Touhy Avenue $2,485,149.44
Des Plaines, IL 60018

Phone: (847) 298-0360

Fax: (847) 298-2689

estimating@]lorigconstruction.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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Letting Item: 002
Route: FAP 347

lllinois Department of Transportation

As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Contract: 62T17

Section: FAP 0347 22 BJ3
Project: NHPPE3Q6(948)

Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM

District: 1
County: DuPage
Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: (760-Ft) Bridge Deck Overlay, Bridge Joint Replacement / Repair at IL 38 (Roosevelt Rd) at IL
53. This project is located in the Village of Glen Ellyn in DuPage County.

4969

3574

1552

Rausch Infrastructure, LLC

1111 E Touhy Avenue, Suite 120
Des Plaines, IL 60018

Phone: (708) 667-0165

Fax: (847) 813-9710
mijkovalsky@rausch.lic

MYS, Incorporated

12416 S. Harlem Ave

Palos Heights, IL 60463
Phone: (708) 448-0983

Fax: (708) 448-8098
tyelnick@mysincorporated.com

Dunnet Bay Construction Company

115 N. Brandon Drive
Glendale Heights, IL 60139
Phone: (630) 539-1200
Fax: (630) 539-4171
estimating@dunnetbay.net

$2,497,798.94

$2,731,148.21

(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 003 Contract: 62T30 District: 1
Route: FAP 870 Section: FAP 0870 22 BJ County: DuPage
Project: NHPPJSQ5(268) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: (307-Ft) Bridge preservation project: Deck overlay, Joints replacement/repair. Located on IL 53 /
Rohlwing Road, at Canadian National (CN) Railroad (approximately 0.1-miles South of Fullerton Avenue) in the
Village of Addison.

3702 Martam Construction Incorporated

1200 Gasket Dr $1,491,736.10
Elgin, IL 60120

Phone: (847) 608-6800
Fax: (847) 608-6804

0204 Areatha Construction Co., Inc.

410 E. North Avenue $1,631,456.07
Streamwood, IL 60107

Phone: (630) 830-9853

Fax: (630) 830-9856

areathaconstco@sbcglobal.net

4969 Rausch Infrastructure, LLC

1111 E Touhy Avenue, Suite 120 $1.748.357.50
Des Plaines, IL 60018

Phone: (708) 667-0165

Fax: (847) 813-9710

mjkovalsky@rausch.llc

3505  Lorig Construction Company

250 East Touhy Avenue $1,779,784.50
Des Plaines, IL 60018

Phone: (847) 298-0360

Fax: (847) 298-2689

estimating@]lorigconstruction.com

2779 ICC Group Inc.

39W866 Fabyan Parkway $1,933,000.00
Elburn, IL 60119

Phone: (630) 232-7280

Fax: (630) 232-7281

estimating@icceo.com

3574 MYS, Incorporated

12416 S. Harlem Ave $1,939.194.59
Palos Heights, IL 60463

Phone: (708) 448-0983

Fax: (708) 448-8098

tyelnick@mysincorporated.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 003 Contract: 62T30 District: 1
Route: FAP 870 Section: FAP 0870 22 BJ County: DuPage
Project: NHPPJSQ5(268) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: (307-Ft) Bridge preservation project: Deck overlay, Joints replacement/repair. Located on IL 53 /
Rohlwing Road, at Canadian National (CN) Railroad (approximately 0.1-miles South of Fullerton Avenue) in the
Village of Addison.

1552  Dunnet Bay Construction Company

115 N. Brandon Drive $2,010,76271
Glendale Heights, IL 60139

Phone: (630) 539-1200

Fax: (630) 539-4171

estimating@dunnetbay.net

2166  Granite Construction Company

585 West Beach Street $2.135,417.27
Watsonville, CA 95076

2215 Sanders Road

Suite 400

Northbrook, IL 60062

Phone: (847) 919-8200

Fax: (847) 272-5930

gmcivilestimating@gcinc.com

0103 Alliance Contractors, Inc.

1166 Lake Avenue (No Bid)
Woodstock, IL 60098

Phone: (815) 338-5900

Fax: (815) 338-9109

estimating@alliancecontractors.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 004 Contract: 64N05 District: 2
Route: FAI 80 Section: (37-1)RS,(37-1HB,1VBY)BDR, County: Henry
(81-
Project: NHPPL5ND(674) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 5.795 miles of pavement patching, HMA resurfacing, HMA surface removal, the removal and
replacement of concrete bridge decks for SNs 037-0023 and 037-0024 over Cleveland Road, deck replacements and
deck repairs for SN-s 037-0021 and 037-0022 over the Rock River, deck repairs for SN-s 037-0027 and 037-0028
over the lowa Interstate Railroad, and other necessary work to complete the proposed improvements along 1-80 from
the Rock River to US 6.

1053  Civil Constructors d/b/a Helm Civil and Phoenix Corporation of the Quad Cities

2283 Business Highway 20 East $24.521,613.02
Freeport, IL 61032

6210  Valley Construction Co.

3610 78 Avenue West $26,094.945 .83
Rock Island, IL 61201

Phone: (309) 787-0292

Fax: (309) 787-7048

estimating@yvalleyconstruction.com

3375 Langman Construction, Inc.

220 - 34th Avenue $28,368,79271
Rock Island, IL 61201

Phone: (309) 786-8944

Fax: (309) 786-2107

Ici@mchsi.com

0049  Advanced Asphalt Company

Princeton, IL 61356

308 W Railroad Ave
Princeton, IL 61356
Phone: (815) 872-9911
Fax: (815) 872-0569
bbruins@advasphalt.biz

0204 Areatha Construction Co., Inc.

410 E. North Avenue (NO Bld)
Streamwood, IL 60107

Phone: (630) 830-9853

Fax: (630) 830-9856

areathaconstco@sbcglobal.net

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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Letting Item: 005
Route:

lllinois Department of Transportation
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Contract:
FAI 74 Section:
Project:

(14HB)BR,(14B)BR-1
NHPPNOL7(973)

Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM

District: 5
County: Champaign
Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 287" bridge repairs and bridge deck overlay at Saline Branch 0.8 mi west of US 45 and US 45 N
of Urbana. SN's 010-0022 and 010-0023.

5672

0958

5310

Stark Excavating, Inc.

1805 W Washington St.
Bloomington, IL 61701

Phone: (309) 828-5034

Fax: (309) 829-3897
estimating@starkcompanies.com

William Charles Construction Company, LLC

P.O. Box 2071

Loves Park, IL 61130
833 Featherstone Road
Rockford, IL 61107
Phone: (815) 654-4700
Fax: (815) 654-4736
bids@williamcharles.com

Sangamo Construction Company

2100 East Moffat St
Springfield, IL 62702
Phone: (217) 544-9871
Fax: (217) 544-9873
office@sangamo.net

$4,119,980.75

$4,914,000.00

(No Bid)

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 006 Contract: 70E63 District: 5
Route: FAS 331 Section: L-BR-1 County: Vermilion
Project: HIBR6BBO0(796) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: Bridge deck overlay and other repairs to SN 092-0177. About 875'.

5310  Sangamo Construction Company

2100 East Moffat St $1,957,705.83
Springfield, IL 62702
Phone: (217) 544-9871
Fax: (217) 544-9873
office@sangamo.net

5672  Stark Excavating, Inc.

1805 W Washington St. $2,049,385.20
Bloomington, IL 61701

Phone: (309) 828-5034

Fax: (309) 829-3897

estimating@starkcompanies.com

0958  William Charles Construction Company, LLC

P.O. Box 2071 $2,449,000.00
Loves Park, IL 61130

833 Featherstone Road
Rockford, IL 61107
Phone: (815) 654-4700
Fax: (815) 654-4736
bids@williamcharles.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 007 Contract: 70HO1 District: 5
Route: FAI 57 Section: (21-27B-2)BR County: Douglas
Project: NHPP575D(356) Within Estimate: NO

Contract Description: 113.2' bridge repairs and overlay at Scattering Fork River 1.5 mi south of US 36.

5310  Sangamo Construction Company

2100 East Moffat St $2,185,889.35
Springfield, IL 62702
Phone: (217) 544-9871
Fax: (217) 544-9873
office@sangamo.net

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 008 Contract: 72122 District: 6
Route: FAP 668 Section: 28(R-2,RS-8) County: Sangamon
Project: NHPP-HSIPGI62(626) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 1.7 miles of reconstruction, milling and resurfacing, ADA improvements and accessible
pedestrian traffic signals on Dirksen Parkway in Springfield, from 0.1 miles south of Peoria Road to north of Northfield
Drive.

2825 lllinois Valley Paving, a div of UCM, Inc.

P.O. Box 13420 $5,572,390.76
Springfield, IL 62791

3151 Robbins Road
Springfield, IL 62704
Phone: (217) 546-6192
Fax: (217) 546-1904
IVP@ucm.biz

0635 P. H. Broughton & Sons, Inc.

905 N. Lincoln Ave. $6,544,870.55
Springfield, IL 62702

Phone: (217) 787-2393

Fax: (217) 787-2397

kent@phbroughton.com

1810 Truman L. Flatt & Sons Co., Inc.

2300 North 16th Street $6,736,573.02
Springfield, IL 62702

Phone: (217) 544-3471

Fax: (217) 544-0861

rem@trumanlflatt.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 009 Contract: 72426 District: 6
Route: FAP 322 Section: (11-12)N County: Christian
Project: HSIPPMQW(864) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: Intersection reconstruction on US 51 at Leafland Street (CH 6) in Assumption.

1810 Truman L. Flatt & Sons Co., Inc.

2300 North 16th Street $2.733,196.40
Springfield, IL 62702
Phone: (217) 544-3471
Fax: (217) 544-0861
rem@trumanlflatt.com

2825 lllinois Valley Paving, a div of UCM, Inc.

P.O. Box 13420 $2,975,324.87
Springfield, IL 62791

3151 Robbins Road
Springfield, IL 62704
Phone: (217) 546-6192
Fax: (217) 546-1904
IVP@ucm.biz

0635 P. H. Broughton & Sons, Inc.

905 N. Lincoln Ave. (NO Bld)
Springfield, IL 62702

Phone: (217) 787-2393

Fax: (217) 787-2397

kent@phbroughton.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 010 Contract: 72M81 District: 6
Route: VARIOUS Section: 84-5-1(BRR,RS-2) County: Sangamon
Project: NHPP-STP4CEG6(723) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: Pavement patching, resurfacing, HMA shoulders, aggregate shoulders, grading and shaping
ditches, rumble strips, and bridge repairs to SN 084-0111 on [-55 from 0.7 miles south of IL 104 to 0.5 miles north of
Horse Farm Road/Old Route 66 at the Glenarm Interchange and on Horse Farm Road/Old Route 66 from 0.4 miles
west to 1 mile east of |-55.

2825 lllinois Valley Paving, a div of UCM, Inc.

P.O. Box 13420 $17,664,189.97
Springfield, IL 62791

3151 Robbins Road
Springfield, IL 62704
Phone: (217) 546-6192
Fax: (217) 546-1904
IVP@ucm.biz

0635 P. H. Broughton & Sons, Inc.

905 N. Lincoln Ave. (No Bid)
Springfield, IL 62702

Phone: (217) 787-2393

Fax: (217) 787-2397

kent@phbroughton.com

1810 Truman L. Flatt & Sons Co., Inc.

2300 North 16th Street (No Bid)
Springfield, IL 62702

Phone: (217) 544-3471

Fax: (217) 544-0861

rem@trumanlflatt.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 011 Contract: 74B41 District: 7
Route: FAI 70 Section: D7 BRIDGE REPAIRS 2024- County: Cumberland
12
Project: NHPPKFMZ(873) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 0.08 mile of bridge deck overlay, bridge joint replace/repair, bridge approach roadway, and
bridge deck repairs at Cottonwood Creek, 0.1 mile east of CR 1125E (overhead).

5306 Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.

PO Box 1555
Murphysboro, IL 62966
Phone: (618) 687-5500
Fax: (618) 684-9341
info@samron.com

$1,564,297.36

5310  Sangamo Construction Company

2100 East Moffat St
Springfield, IL 62702
Phone: (217) 544-9871
Fax: (217) 544-9873
office@sangamo.net

$1,848,054.04

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 012 Contract: 76U07 District: 8
Route: FAI 70 Section: 60-7BJR-BDR County: Madison
Project: NHPPUL93(962) Within Estimate: NO

Contract Description: Bridge joint replacement/repairs and bridge deck overlay on SN 060-0014 and 060-0015
carrying 1-55/70 over Beltline Road.

3085 Keeley & Sons, Inc.

6303 Collinsville Road $2.833,155.74
East St. Louis, IL 62201

Phone: (618) 271-7470

Fax: (618) 271-0830
Brian.Lurk@keeleyandsons.com

3157  The Kilian Corporation

P.O. Box A $2,903,309.92
Mascoutah, IL 62258

608 South Independence Street
Mascoutah, IL 62258

Phone: (618) 566-2000

Fax: (618) 566-2314
sharon.weier@kiliancorp.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 013 Contract: 78633 District: 9
Route: FAS 2887 Section: 113R-1 County: Williamson
Project: STP1LQI(305) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 7.8 miles of resurfacing, HMA shoulders, aggregate shoulders, earthwork, culvert replacement,
tree removal, guardrail updates, addition of a right turn lane, and construction of a roundabout on IL 37, south of
Marion, from Wildcat Road to IL 148.

5550 E. T. Simonds Construction Company

PO Box 2107 $16,365,140.64
Carbondale, IL 62902

1500 N Oakland Ave
PO Box 2107
Carbondale, IL 62902
Phone: (618) 457-8191
Fax: (618) 549-0131
jjones@etsimonds.com

5306  Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.

PO Box 1555 $16,818,061.50
Murphysboro, IL 62966

Phone: (618) 687-5500
Fax: (618) 684-9341
info@samron.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 014 Contract: 78798 District: 9
Route: FAI 57 Section:  (X1-8,X1-7-1,X1-7,X1-6-1)R-2  County: Williamson
Project: NHFP-NHPP60UH(363) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 8 miles of earthwork, HMA pavement, HMA resurfacing, drainage and guardrail in order to add a
lane in each direction of I-57 from Westminster Drive in Marion to just south of the 1-24 interchange.

5306 Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.

PO Box 1555 $41,665,229.94
Murphysboro, IL 62966

Phone: (618) 687-5500
Fax: (618) 684-9341
info@samron.com

5550 E. T. Simonds Construction Company

PO Box 2107 $44,982,683.47
Carbondale, IL 62902

1500 N Oakland Ave
PO Box 2107
Carbondale, IL 62902
Phone: (618) 457-8191
Fax: (618) 549-0131
jjones@etsimonds.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 015 Contract: 78A27 District: 9
Route: FAP 42 Section: (8-1B,8-1B-1)BRR-1 County: Perry
Project: BRUG6D3(736) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: Joint reconstruction with strip seals, base course widening, bridge deck, approach slab and
structure repair, deck scarification, microsilica concrete overlay and approach HMA mill and fill on SN 073-0025
carrying IL 127 over Swanwick Creek and SN 073-0026 carrying IL 127 over Swanwick Creek Overflow north of
Pinckneyville.

5550 E. T. Simonds Construction Company

PO Box 2107 $888,873.80
Carbondale, IL 62902

1500 N Oakland Ave
PO Box 2107
Carbondale, IL 62902
Phone: (618) 457-8191
Fax: (618) 549-0131
jjones@etsimonds.com

5306 Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.

PO Box 1555 $898,477.09
Murphysboro, IL 62966

Phone: (618) 687-5500
Fax: (618) 684-9341
info@samron.com

3157  The Kilian Corporation

Mascoutah, IL 62258

608 South Independence Street
Mascoutah, IL 62258

Phone: (618) 566-2000

Fax: (618) 566-2314
sharon.weier@kiliancorp.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 016 Contract: 78A65 District: 9
Route: FAS 1887A; SBI 13B; SBI Section: 6RS-3 County: Williamson
13C
Project: STPADPF(397) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 7.8 miles of standard overlay on Crab Orchard Road from the IL 13 West Connector to the IL 13
East Connector.

5306 Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.

PO Box 1555 $643,011.50
Murphysboro, IL 62966
Phone: (618) 687-5500
Fax: (618) 684-9341
info@samron.com

5550 E. T. Simonds Construction Company

PO Box 2107 $692,800.29
Carbondale, IL 62902

1500 N Oakland Ave
PO Box 2107
Carbondale, IL 62902
Phone: (618) 457-8191
Fax: (618) 549-0131
jjones@etsimonds.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 017 Contract: 78A67 District: 9
Route: FAP 331 Section: (10,11,11-1)RS-2 County: Gallatin
Project: NHPPDLHD(014) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 8.8 miles of HMA surface removal, HMA resurfacing, aggregate wedge shoulders, pavement
patching and guardrail improvements on IL 13 from IL 1 to the Old Shawneetown Bridge.

5550 E. T. Simonds Construction Company

PO Box 2107 $3,871,636.69
Carbondale, IL 62902

1500 N Oakland Ave
PO Box 2107
Carbondale, IL 62902
Phone: (618) 457-8191
Fax: (618) 549-0131
jjones@etsimonds.com

5306  Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.

PO Box 1555 $4,014,241.59
Murphysboro, IL 62966

Phone: (618) 687-5500
Fax: (618) 684-9341
info@samron.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 018 Contract: 78A70 District: 9
Route: FAP 726 Section: 113RS-4 County: Johnson
Project: STPCXZB(835) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 1.1 miles of pavement patching, HMA surface removal and HMA resurfacing on IL 37 from the
Williamson County line to 0.2 miles south of 1-24.

5306 Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.

PO Box 1555
Murphysboro, IL 62966
Phone: (618) 687-5500
Fax: (618) 684-9341
info@samron.com

$659,171.95

5550 E. T. Simonds Construction Company

PO Box 2107 $684,292.34
Carbondale, IL 62902

1500 N Oakland Ave
PO Box 2107
Carbondale, IL 62902
Phone: (618) 457-8191
Fax: (618) 549-0131
jjones@etsimonds.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 019 Contract: 78A71 District: 9
Route: FAP 885 Section: 106RS-6 County: Union
Project: NHPP-STPK3UJ(878) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 6 miles of overlay on IL 146 from 0.5 miles west of I-57 to the Johnson County line.

5306 Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.

PO Box 1555 $2,148,209.76
Murphysboro, IL 62966

Phone: (618) 687-5500
Fax: (618) 684-9341
info@samron.com

5550 E. T. Simonds Construction Company

PO Box 2107 $2,179,187.98
Carbondale, IL 62902

1500 N Oakland Ave
PO Box 2107
Carbondale, IL 62902
Phone: (618) 457-8191
Fax: (618) 549-0131
jjones@etsimonds.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 020 Contract: 78A82 District: 9
Route: FAP 861 Section: (111,X,566)RS-3 County: Perry
Project: STPF4ZM(094) Within Estimate: YES

Contract Description: 3 miles of resurfacing on IL 150 from IL 4 to Reeses Hill Road in Culter.

5306 Samron Midwest Contracting, Inc.

PO Box 1555 $974,235.81
Murphysboro, IL 62966
Phone: (618) 687-5500
Fax: (618) 684-9341
info@samron.com

5550 E. T. Simonds Construction Company

PO Box 2107 $1,098,917.73
Carbondale, IL 62902

1500 N Oakland Ave
PO Box 2107
Carbondale, IL 62902
Phone: (618) 457-8191
Fax: (618) 549-0131
jjones@etsimonds.com

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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lllinois Department of Transportation Run Time 12/13/2024 12:10 PM
As Accepted Tabulation of Bids
For Letting: 12/13/2024

Letting Item: 021 Contract: 93671 District: 6
Route: FAU 8153; FAU 8048 Section: 07-00164-04-FP 07-00090-08- County: Sangamon
FP
Project: BWWL(183) Within Estimate: NO

Contract Description: Construction of two structures: Iron Bridge Road over the Union Pacific Railroad, and the Union
Pacific Railroad over Woodside Road. Work includes; pedestrian truss bridge over Woodside Road, reconstruction of
the signalized intersection of Iron Bridge and Woodside, and the relocation of the Interurban Trail.

1908 Freesen, a div of UCM, Inc.

P.O. Box 13420 $53,369,021.54
Springfield, IL 62791

3151 Robbins Road
Springfield, IL 62704
Phone: (217) 546-6192
Fax: (217) 546-1904
Fl@ucm.biz

5310  Sangamo Construction Company

2100 East Moffat St (No Bid)
Springfield, IL 62702

Phone: (217) 544-9871

Fax: (217) 544-9873

office@sangamo.net

This list is an aid and is not intended to be an all-inclusive list of potential bidders. It is the responsibility of the bidder, subcontractor or vendor to
determine who is bidding on a project.
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